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LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF ALBERTA 

Title: Tuesday, November 13, 1979 2:30 p.m. 

[The House met at 2:30 p.m.] 

PRAYERS 

[Mr. Speaker in the Chair] 

head: INTRODUCTION OF BILLS 

Bill 74 
The Legislative Assembly 

Amendment Act, 1979 (No. 2) 

MR. C R A W F O R D : Mr. Speaker, in light of observa­
tions you previously made in regard to whether Bill 74 
was a money Bill, I would like now to present the 
message of His Honour in respect of that Bill. 

This being a money Bill, His Honour the Honour­
able the Lieutenant-Governor has been informed of the 
contents and recommends the same to the Assembly. 

head: INTRODUCTION OF SPECIAL GUESTS 

MR. ISLEY: Mr. Speaker, it is my pleasure to introduce 
to you, and through you to Members of the Legisla­
tive Assembly, the reeve of the municipal district of 
Bonnyville. He is accompanied by his wife, Kate, and a 
friend, John Antoniuk. They are seated in the members 
gallery, and I would ask that they stand and receive the 
welcome of the House. 

MRS. LeMESSURIER: Mr. Speaker, it's a pleasure for 
me to introduce to you, and through you to members 
of this Assembly, students from the Alberta Vocational 
Centre accompanied by their group leader, Ada Nan-
ning. I'd like them to rise and receive the welcome of 
the House. 

DR. CARTER: Mr. Speaker, I would like to introduce 
to you, and through you to members of the Legisla­
ture, 30 grade 9 students from Sherwood school located 
in the interesting area of Ogden, within the equally 
interesting constituency of Calgary Millican. They are 
accompanied by one of their teachers, Mr. Ron 
Eremenko. 

In addition, a word of appreciation should be ex­
pressed to the South Calgary Rotary Club, which 
sponsored this educational trip. Incidentally, the Mem­
ber for Calgary McCall is a member of that 
organization. 

I would ask that the students and their teacher rise 
and be welcomed by the Assembly. 

head: MINISTERIAL STATEMENTS 

Office of the Premier 

MR. LOUGHEED: Mr. Speaker, I would like to report 
to the Legislature on events which transpired yesterday 

in Ottawa relative to energy matters and oil and gas 
pricing in particular. 

We were very pleased that all provinces, except On­
tario, essentially concurred both that oil prices must 
rise steadily towards world commodity values and that 
the provincial ownership rights over resources be fully 
respected. 

There were no negotiations on price between the 
federal government and the government of Alberta 
while I was in Ottawa. These negotiations will resume 
at a meeting between me and the Prime Minister 
tomorrow afternoon in Saskatoon, where we will be 
joined by our respective ministers of energy. 

There is one specific point on the negotiations, Mr. 
Speaker, that requires some clarification. Views have 
been expressed that the petroleum industry's share of 
increased prices could be of such a magnitude that it 
could not be fully invested effectively, and that their 
profits generally will increase substantially, particular­
ly for the major oil producers. We are generally in­
clined to hold our royalty rates at their present levels, 
but intend to be in a position to reassess periodically 
whether or not the industry's share of increased prices is 
reinvested in finding new energy supplies for Cana­
dians. The federal government shares this concern and 
has been discussing with us various ways of taxing 
increased profits by petroleum producers, particularly if 
the funds are are not reinvested. It should be noted, 
though, that the petroleum industry in Canada has an 
excellent record, between 1974 and 1979, in reinvesting. 

The Prime Minister stated in the House of Commons 
last night, on reporting on the conference yesterday, 
that, and I quote: 

We proposed a special tax on incremental oil 
company profits to help finance Canadian energy 
development. Officials of our government will be 
consulting with provinces and the industry to de­
sign the most effective tax. 

Mr. Speaker, I have however made it very clear to the 
Prime Minister on a number of occasions that federal 
tax measures cannot be designed as a means of skim­
ming off resource revenues which belong to the peo­
ple of Alberta. We are not prepared to agree to stage 
in wellhead price increases of crude oil unless the 
province's ownership rights of its resources are fully 
respected, and this includes the revenues from the sale 
of those resources. Put another way, we will not agree 
to staging in wellhead price increases if any effort is 
made by the federal government to alter, directly or 
indirectly, the revenue flows or distribution of the prov­
ince from these resources without the province's 
concurrence. 

Mr. Speaker, we have made it abundantly clear to the 
federal government that we would not in principle 
find acceptable a federal royalty upon Alberta's oil; that 
is an entirely different matter from federal tax measures 
on the profits of petroleum producers. 

There is an important matter of basic principle in­
volved here. I propose to re-emphasize this position 
with the Prime Minister again tomorrow, so that he 
understands Alberta's fundamental position on the li­
mits of federal taxation measures. 

At the same time, Mr. Speaker, I'd like to table a copy 
of the notes of my opening statement yesterday at the 
conference. 
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head: ORAL QUESTION PERIOD 

Energy Talks 

MR. R. SPEAKER: Mr. Speaker, I'd like to direct my 
question to the Premier. It's with regard to the state­
ment and the negotiations that I understand will pro­
ceed tomorrow with the Prime Minister, and following 
with other premiers. 

The indications from the conference are that it is the 
desire that oil prices should be increased by $1 in 
January and $3 in July, and then $2 every six months 
until the Chicago composite price or a percentage 
thereof is reached. Could the Premier make any com­
ment with regard to that at this time? 

MR. LOUGHEED: Mr. Speaker, it's a fair question 
from the hon. member. I presume he's reading from a 
document made public by the federal government yes­
terday, headed "Outline of Proposed Initial Stage of 
National Energy Strategy". These involved matters 
presented by the federal government. For our part, we 
are not prepared to respond in the Legislature as to 
any specific pricing regime which is still the subject 
of negotiation. 

MR. PAHL: A supplementary question, Mr. Speaker. 
Although I appreciate it's not the negotiation, would 
the Premier or the Minister of Energy and Natural 
Resources be able to clarify whether option four was 
actually presented during the negotiations? 

MR. LOUGHEED: Mr. Speaker, I'd refer that question 
to the Minister of Energy and Natural Resources. 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Speaker, option four, as it has been 
referred to, which was a $1 per barrel price increase on 
January 1, 1980, and $3 per barrel every six months 
thereafter, was never proposed to us in that form. Very 
early in the discussions, there was a proposal for such 
increases, but it included a skimming or a return of 
certain portions of that revenue to the federal govern­
ment. As all Members of the Legislative Assembly 
would be aware, that position was wholly unacceptable 
to the province of Alberta. 

MR. R. SPEAKER: Mr. Speaker, a supplementary ques­
tion to the Premier. In the statement to the Assembly 
the Premier has indicated that the federal government 
would like to implement a special tax. There was also 
indication with regard to the formation of a national 
energy bank. 

Could the Premier elaborate further on the possible 
relationship of those two areas? 

MR. LOUGHEED: Mr. Speaker, I'm sure the hon. 
member appreciates the difficulty that in part we're 
dealing with negotiations that seem to be in the 
public arena and in part with negotiations that have 
not been. On that question, though, I believe it is in 
the public domain, so to speak. 

As far as Alberta is concerned, we have taken a 
position in the same way that I responded here to the 
select committee of the Legislative Assembly, in Sep­
tember I believe. We would consider loans to any such 
national energy bank from the Heritage Savings 
Trust Fund as merely an extension of our Canada 
investment division, provided they were guaranteed by 

the government of Canada and provided they went at 
prevailing interest rates, having regard to that partic­
ular guarantee. We are not prepared to be an equity 
participant in such a national energy bank, but that 
isn't to say that we might not work with the national 
energy bank in a co-operative, perhaps joint-venture 
way in specific energy projects in various parts of the 
country. 

Senior Citizens' Programs 

MR. MANDEVILLE: Thank you; Mr. Speaker. My 
question is to the hon. Minister of Social Services and 
Community Health. It's to follow up the question I 
asked last week with regard to the legislation being 
passed by the federal government, where widows and 
widowers who were on spouses' allowance — they were 
discontinued six months after death of the pensioner. 

Will these particular people, who are now going to 
be on the spouses' allowance, qualify for the assured 
income supplement from the province? 

MR. BOGLE: Mr. Speaker, when asked the question 
several days ago, I indicated that I would take it as 
notice. We're currently attempting to get clarification 
from the federal government as to their legislation. 
Once that's been completed, we'll assess it to determine 
the impact on our policies, and make whatever adjust­
ments the government feels necessary. 

MR. MANDEVILLE: Mr. Speaker, a supplementary 
question to the hon. Minister of Housing and Public 
Works. When they're reinstated on the spouses' allow­
ance, will the widowers and widows qualify for the 
senior citizens' home improvement program? If so, 
will they have to make application for this? 

MR. C H A M B E R S : Mr. Speaker, the policy in that area 
has always been and continues to be that if one of the 
parties dies and they have applied for a pioneer repair 
grant — in other words, one spouse is over 65 and one 
is under, and the party over 65 applies and then dies — 
then the spouse under 65 continues to have that grant. 

MR. M A N D E V I L L E : A supplementary question to the 
Minister of Municipal Affairs. Will these same recipi­
ents qualify for the renters' assistance now enjoyed by 
our senior citizens? 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Speaker, I believe those matters are 
contained in the legislation that provides for the renter 
assistance rebate, which was most recently amended last 
spring. Our position there, I would think, is that the 
remaining spouse, if under 65 years of age, would not 
qualify in succeeding years for the additional renter 
assistance benefit. However, the same situation would 
apply where a couple applied for the senior citizens' 
renter assistance and, before the application might 
have been processed or the cheque in hand, one of the 
partners — the one over 65 — passed away. My 
memory, at least, is that we have not stopped payment 
in those cases, but have continued to follow through 
and honor the application. 

Transport of Chemicals 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, my question is to the hon. 
Minister of Transportation. It's to follow up a question 
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I asked earlier in the session as to the movement of 
hazardous chemicals within the province. Can the min­
ister indicate what steps, if any, have been taken in 
consultation with the minister's federal counterpart as 
to the movement of hazardous chemicals in this 
province? 

MR. KROEGER: Mr. Speaker, we are talking to the 
federal people and urging them to move with what is 
now Bill C-17, keeping in mind that the movement of 
these kinds of goods tends to be interprovincial. Unless 
there's a federal statute covering it, it would be very 
difficult to handle it provincially. I am now drafting a 
letter to the hon. Mr. Mazankowski, inviting him to 
step up the timing on C-17. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, to the minister. In the 
movement of chemicals intraprovincially, has the min­
ister received any recommendations or done any studies 
on the moving of chemicals within the province by 
unit trains with so-called experts riding on those 
trains? 

MR. KROEGER: I would refer that question to the 
Minister of Economic Development. 

MR. PLANCHE: Mr. Speaker, the question asked was 
interprovincially. That's the one that the previous min­
ister responded to. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, to the hon. member. Within 
the province — intra. 

MR. PLANCHE: I'd like to take notice of that and 
check back through the files, Mr. Speaker. 

MRS. FYFE: A supplementary question, Mr. Speaker. 
Could the Minister of Transportation advise how Bill 
C-17 would affect Alberta as to safety in transporting 
materials? 

MR. SPEAKER: Order please. The Bill is undoubtedly 
public knowledge. Surely the hon. member would be 
able to make her own assessment. 

DR. BUCK: A supplementary question to the Minister 
of Transportation. Has the minister received any repre­
sentation from the town of Fort Saskatchewan as to a 
cost-sharing program to put controlled crossings 
within the municipal limits of Fort Saskatchewan to 
prevent, say, large transports running into slow-
moving trains? 

MR. KROEGER: Mr. Speaker, I recall having some 
conversations with people from Fort Saskatchewan. I 
don't recall a request in writing, but yes, we have been 
talking. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, a supplementary question to 
the Solicitor General. In light of the fact that an 
emergency mechanism is in place in Fort Saskatche­
wan as far as the plants and the citizens go, can the 
minister indicate what procedures are in place to eva­
cuate the correctional institute in Fort Saskatchewan in 
the event of an emergency? 

MR. H A R L E : I'd have to take that question as notice, 
Mr. Speaker. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, to the Minister responsible 
for Workers' Health, Safety and Compensation. Has 
there been any direction to make sure that, in the 
movement of hazardous chemicals, containers are pro­
perly labelled so firemen fighting fires in the nature of 
hazardous chemical materials will know what they are 
dealing with? 

MR. DIACHUK: Mr. Speaker, that is part of the con­
cern and the consideration that my officials have had in 
proposing the amendments now in Bill 71. 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Speaker, I wonder if I might pro­
vide some additional information in my responsibilities 
as minister responsible for Disaster Services with re­
spect to the matter of transportation of dangerous 
goods. 

Members mentioned Bill C-17, the federal legislation 
which died on the Order Paper before the last federal 
election and which, in my understanding, is due to be 
introduced again in this session of Parliament. I would 
like to say that in connection with that proposed feder­
al legislation a national dangerous goods code was 
established which is, in essence, regulations that 
might be applied when the federal legislation is 
passed. That national dangerous goods code is now 
being carried out across Canada by the dangerous 
goods branch of the federal Department of Transport. 

In co-operation with the federal Department of 
Transport in that branch, the Alberta Disaster Services 
Agency has developed a number of initiatives to deal 
with transportation of dangerous goods in Alberta. 
Over the last 18 months, they have developed a three-
day dangerous goods instructors' course, into its 
eighth session, I believe, at the end of this month. So 
far it has seen some 140 candidates including fire, 
police, and municipal representatives. Both railways 
have been involved in that course, as well as federal, 
provincial, and municipal officials and people from 
industry, including a number from the industrial 
complex in the Fort Saskatchewan area. 

In addition, the transportation safety branch of our 
own Department of Transportation has been working 
extensively with the Disaster Services Agency in order 
to correlate data respecting the transportation of dan­
gerous goods and to undertake to ascertain what kinds 
of accidents occur and their causes. The special 
accident-investigating team of that branch has inves­
tigated a number of accidents thus far. 

Mr. Speaker, after the enactment of federal legisla­
tion, which we hope will occur in the next six to eight 
months, I believe the province of Alberta will be in a 
position of being able to fall directly in line with the 
national code being established for the transportation 
of dangerous goods, and to have a lot of things like 
instructors' courses and a central data-collection system 
that locates the movement of dangerous goods 
throughout our province. It's my belief that we'll have 
all those things in place when the federal legislation 
is proclaimed, so that we'll have a workable system 
which will result in some continuity right across 
Canada. 

In conclusion, Mr. Speaker, I say that I trust mem­
bers appreciate that in the transportation, as opposed to 
the storing, of dangerous goods it is essential in our 
view that we have national legislation and a nationally 
co-ordinated program. I think we can be a part of that. 
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DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, a supplementary question to 
the. Minister of Transportation, to follow up a question 
I asked earlier in the session. The by-passing of Fort 
Saskatchewan and the cross-linkage of the CNR and 
CPR lines — can the hon. minister indicate if any 
progress has been made in this direction? 

MR. KROEGER: Mr. Speaker, is the hon. member ref­
erring to railway intersections? Then I'm afraid I'll 
have to refer that to the Minister of Economic Devel­
opment, because the railway doesn't fall in the area of 
the Department of Transportation. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, the question then is to the 
Minister of Economic Development. This has to do 
with the crossing over of the CNR line and by-passing 
Fort Saskatchewan and taking the CPR line, which is 
within a few miles of the CNR line. Has there been any 
consideration or advisement to the agencies involved, 
CN and CP, as to the rerouting of hazardous chemicals 
around the town of Fort Saskatchewan? 

MR. PLANCHE: Mr. Speaker, I recall that Dr. Horner, 
before he left, had engaged in some lengthy discus­
sions on that subject. The people from Fort Saskatche­
wan have made an appointment to meet with me, next 
week I think, and I presume that's what we're going 
to discuss. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, to the Minister of Economic 
Development. In the minister's department, have there 
been any considerations or advisements to the federal 
agency that these trains not be linked up with trains 
carrying inflammable containers, such as the situation 
in Mississauga? 

MR. PLANCHE: That's an important question, Mr. 
Speaker. I'll have to take that as notice and check 
through the correspondence again. 

Edmonton Research and Development Park 

MR. PAHL: Thank you, Mr. Speaker. My question is 
for the Minister of Housing and Public Works, but 
apropos of Disaster Services I'd like to advise the Minis­
ter of Municipal Affairs that we in Edmonton Mill 
Woods have some empathy for the people of Missis­
sauga, and we're pretty good at getting out. 

My question to the Minister of Housing and Public 
Works is with respect to getting people into Mill 
Woods. I wonder if the minister could enlighten the 
House as to whether there have been any major clients 
in the Edmonton industrial research park located in 
Edmonton Mill Woods. 

MR. CHAMBERS: I would have to take that as notice, 
Mr. Speaker. 

Interest Rates — Municipal Loans 

MR. ZAOZIRNY: Mr. Speaker, my question is to the 
hon. Minister of Municipal Affairs. It relates to a 
response he gave in the House last week with respect to 
the interest rate charged on municipal loans. My ques­
tion arises from the plebiscite which is close at hand in 
the city of Calgary regarding the civic centre. 

I wonder if the minister could assure the Assembly 
this afternoon that there has been absolutely no change 

in government policy with respect to interest rates to 
be charged to municipalities in the province. 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Speaker, indeed I can. There has 
been no change whatsoever in government policy 
with respect to the financing by the province of munic­
ipal undertakings. 

The situation is that the Municipal Financing Cor­
poration has funds provided to it from the Alberta 
Heritage Savings Trust Fund and lends to municipal 
governments at what could be considered a preferred 
interest rate, when one considers that a municipal 
government by itself on the open market would in 
most cases pay considerably more than the amount 
currently paid through the Municipal Financing 
Corporation. I believe the Municipal Financing Cor­
poration rate at present is 11.125 per cent, that corpora­
tion of course being the responsibility of my colleague 
the Provincial Treasurer. In addition, we provide an 
annual subsidy that brings the effective interest rate 
down from whatever the municipal corporation's rate is 
to some 8 per cent. That has now been provided, I 
believe, for four years. As I indicated in the House last 
week, during the course of each budget year we dis­
cuss and consider the extent to which that additional 
subsidy below the 11.125 per cent is provided. 

I'd only conclude by saying that a municipality like 
Edmonton or Calgary, in the case of plans they have in 
terms of their financing, has a very preferred rate of 
interest at the existing Municipal Financing Corpora­
tion borrowing rate as compared to what a good 
number of other entities or people might be expected 
to pay today. So I don't believe, Mr. Speaker, that the 
arguments with respect to the validity of the civic 
centre in Calgary or the convention centre in Edmon­
ton should be based on an interest-rate argument, 
when in fact in today's circumstances the municipali­
ties, without the subsidy, have an interest rate probably 
4 per cent below the prime lending rate in Canada. 

MR. ZAOZIRNY: A supplementary question to the 
minister. After the assurance that there has been no 
change in policy, could the minister also assure the 
Assembly that there is no present intention to change 
that policy in future? 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Speaker, I really cannot do that. I 
said last week in the House and would say again that 
the amount of subsidy provided from the Department 
of Municipal Affairs budget has to be reviewed each 
year. Any changes that might occur in that would be 
introduced by the Provincial Treasurer on the tabling 
of the budget. 

MR. ZAOZIRNY: If I could, a final supplementary. 
Perhaps my question wasn't entirely clear, Mr. Speaker. 
I'm not asking whether the policy may change down 
the road. I'm simply asking the minister if he can 
assure the House that there is no present intention to 
change that policy. 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Speaker, on a matter such as that I 
would prefer to keep my intentions to myself and dis­
cuss them with the Provincial Treasurer. In due course, 
early next year I would expect, the budget will be 
tabled in the Legislature and then members will know. 
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Coal Development 

MR. M A N D E V I L L E : Thank you, Mr. Speaker. My 
question is to the hon. Minister of Energy and Natural 
Resources. Could the minister indicate whether he or 
his department or the Energy Resources Conservation 
Board have been approached by Fording Coal with 
regard to mining coal at Bow City? 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Speaker, I don't recall any discus­
sions about mining coal at Bow City. 

ORDERS OF THE DAY 

head: WRITTEN QUESTIONS 

MR. HORSMAN: Mr. Speaker, I would move that the 
question and the motions for returns on the Order 
Paper stand and retain their place. 

[Motion carried] 

head: GOVERNMENT DESIGNATED BUSINESS 

[On motion, the Assembly resolved itself into Commit­
tee of the Whole] 

head: GOVERNMENT BILLS AND ORDERS 
(Committee of the Whole) 

[Mr. Appleby in the Chair] 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Will the Committee of the Whole 
Assembly please come to order. 

Bill 47 
The Mobile Equipment Licensing Repeal Act 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Does the hon. minister have any 
comments? 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Chairman, no. I believe I outlined 
on second reading the purpose of the repeal of the Act. 
I would be pleased to answer any questions there 
might be from members on committee study. But it has 
a rather short clause, and I would recommend that 
members support the principle of removing this licens­
ing requirement and fee by adoption of the Bill. 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any other questions or 
comments? 

MR. R. SPEAKER: Mr. Chairman, can the minister 
indicate what type of income or revenue picture has 
changed with regard to the municipality in the repeal 
of this Bill? Does it have any effect on their revenue? 
And was there consultation prior to initiation of this 
repeal Act? 

MR. MOORE: First, on the revenue: during 1978 we 
collected a total of $3,433,039, distributed to virtually 
all 350 municipal governments. On average, the 
amount is less than 1 per cent of the municipal tax 
levied, although in some particular municipalities it 

becomes a fair bit higher, and in some, of course, a lot 
lower. In some of the improvement districts — for 
example, ID18 — it represented almost 16 per cent of 
the total municipal tax levied. But in that case we were 
dealing largely with things like Syncrude and GCOS 
bucket wheels. We have an option there of levying tax 
against those as machinery and equipment or as mo­
bile equipment. We will take the option of levying the 
tax in another way. So a few of what might have been 
considered very large pieces of mobile equipment will, 
in fact, continue to be taxed. 

Generally speaking, it was a very uneven flow of 
revenue. If a municipality for some reason had a large 
construction project in it one year, it might amount to 
10 per cent of the revenue, and the next year it would 
fall to 0.01 per cent. My information is that we sent out 
a cheque to one municipality in 1978 for 17 cents. They 
must have moved a backhoe through town before 
lunch one day. 

That's about it. On average, it's less than 1 per cent 
of the total revenue municipalities collect. It's hard to 
suggest that some municipalities collect more on 
average year after year, except to say that the benefits to 
rural areas probably are a little greater than they are to 
towns and villages that lie within those rural areas. 

The member asked one further question about con­
sultation. I discussed the matter with the president of 
the Alberta Urban Municipalities Association before it 
was enacted into the Legislature. I also discussed it 
with the Alberta Association of MDs and Counties 
prior to the Bill being introduced. In both cases, they 
expressed the view that it was difficult to lose the 
revenue, but at the same time they recognized that the 
system was really rather outdated and a very expensive 
way to collect tax. Without wanting to put words in 
their mouths, I think both organizations recognized 
that it was an appropriate move for government to 
repeal this Bill and do away with that particular tax. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill No. 47, 
The Mobile Equipment Licensing Repeal Act, be 
reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 56 
The Alberta Labour Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments with respect to this Act? 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill 56, The 
Alberta Labour Amendment Act, 1979, be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 53 
The Department of Education 

Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments? 
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[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. KING: Mr. Chairman, I move that the Bill be 
reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 66 
The Planning Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments with respect to this Act? 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I'd like to ask one or two 
questions of the Minister of Municipal Affairs. Can the 
minister indicate what consultation has taken place 
between the minister or his department and the city of 
Edmonton as to this Bill? Maybe we can get the discus­
sion started there. 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Chairman, major discussions that I 
held prior to the introduction of this legislation were 
with the Urban Municipalities Association and the 
Association of MDs and Counties. In addition, all 
major municipalities with planning departments, in­
cluding Edmonton and Calgary, were quite involved 
in the process that led to the introduction of this Bill, 
in terms of their review of the operations of The 
Planning Act from the fall of 1977 until the present. 

As I think I indicated on second reading, I received 
something like 150 different proposals with respect to 
amendments, which as you might imagine were scaled 
down to something significantly less than that. It was 
our view that in many cases adequate time had not been 
provided for the review in trying to make the legisla­
tion work properly. 

Since the introduction of the legislation, discussions 
relative to various sections of the Bill have been held 
between staff of my department and staff of the city of 
Edmonton. The city did raise a number of concerns 
with respect to the Bill, some of which were as a result 
of a lack of understanding by the city of certain sec­
tions. For example, they had a concern with respect to 
the Minister of Municipal Affairs' authority in special 
areas. They were mistakenly of the belief that "special 
areas" referred to special planning areas, rather than 
the special areas in southern Alberta. There were, 
however, some legitimate concerns of the city of 
Edmonton, and I will just respond to a couple of them 
while I'm on my feet. It might save some further 
questions. 

The first was with respect to our definition of utili­
ties. As members would know, there was no definition 
of utilities in the 1977 Act. We have established a 
definition of utilities in Bill No. 66. The specific 
purpose for establishing that definition was to ensure 
that municipal governments did not enter into a situa­
tion with developers where they forced the developer to 
provide services under the guise of utilities, such as 
rapid transit, cost of arterial roadways, and that kind of 
thing. It's our view, quite simply, that those major 
costs of things like rapid transit and arterial roadways 
should be paid from the general revenues of municipal 
government and from provincial grants available for 
those purposes, and should not be a direct charge on 
property being developed today. 

In that regard, the city of Edmonton, from my 
understanding, has a different point of view. They 

think that everything they can charge to a particular 
development should be charged. My only response is 
simply that we disagree. We don't believe it's very 
conducive to young families trying to buy homes if we 
add $4,000 or $5,000 to the price of a lot, by way of 
these additional charges, that people who already live 
in this city and others did not have levied on their 
residential lot. 

In another area, the city of Calgary expressed the 
viewpoint that utilities should include the installation 
of telephones and power. Later I got a clarification 
from the mayor of Calgary, that they were referring 
not to telephones but only to power. At any rate, I have 
said to those and to the city of Edmonton that our 
Clause 5 in the legislation provides that the Lieutenant 
Governor in Council may prescribe "other things", in 
addition to what is named to be utilities, as a built-in 
safety valve. We had a very difficult time with this 
definition of utilities, wanting to be sure it was not too 
restrictive, yet wanting to be sure we didn't get into a 
situation where a municipality would come along 
with a seemingly very reasonable proposal that should 
be included, and we wouldn't have the ability to do it. 
It's not my intention to use that clause without some 
due regard for the consequences. But I thought it 
essential that we have some flexibility in defining 
additional matters that might be defined as utilities if a 
case were made that seemed to be reasonable. 

The only other part of the Bill that is causing some 
concern is this whole matter of the rights of an indi­
vidual who happens to be an adjoining landowner to 
be heard at some process in the subdivision application 
approval. We took the approach that we would unduly 
restrict progress on the initial application for subdivi­
sion if we allowed that every adjoining landowner 
might be heard. So we said the subdivision-approving 
authority will hear a subdivision application and ap­
prove it without regard to notifying the adjoining 
landowners, or whatever. But once they've made that 
approval, they must advertise it, and say this is what 
we've approved. The adjoining landowners would 
have a period of 14 days in which to file an appeal, and 
then could be heard at two different levels of appeal: 
one at the subdivision appeal board level and the other 
at the provincial planning board level. 

The concern being expressed is simply that the noti­
fying of adjoining landowners of a subdivison ap­
proval by letter is a task they did not have to undertake 
before, and it indeed costs them money, takes some 
time, and is an additional problem that municipalities 
didn't have to cope with before. I hope the records of 
municipal governments, in terms of the land titles and 
so on, will be of a sufficient nature to allow them to 
notify adjoining landowners of subdivision approvals 
without any great costs, and that that can be done. I 
have said to a couple of municipalities who have been 
concerned about that, I'd like to try it and see how it 
works. If it seems entirely too onerous we might at a 
later date make amendments to ensure that such notifi­
cation can take the form of a newspaper advertisement. 
But, having been through this newspaper advertise­
ment bit before, I sometimes wonder about the validity 
of half a page in the Edmonton Journal that simply 
says, here are all the subdivisions and they have legal 
descriptions. How owners know that that's next door to 
them, I don't know. So I've been reluctant to accede to 
the requests that we change that particular section in 
the Bill. I'm not sure if it's written in here, but — 
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whether it's in here, or in the other Act, or wherever it 
is — the intention is that the notification would have to 
be in a direct way: in other words, by post, or hand-
delivered, or something. 

So that's the other area causing concern. I don't 
think it's going to result in any delays, but some 
additional costs. It's been cited that there may be a 
subdivision application of, say, 30 or 40 acres in an 
outlying part of the city — an area that's not yet been 
developed, that might be ringed by individual lots — 
and you might have to serve 200 notices that a subdivi­
sion has been approved. But surely that sort of situation 
wouldn't occur very often. I can't think of too many 
places where you would have to notify that many 
landowners. In most cases you'd be notifying less than 
a dozen landowners, and in many cases only one or two. 
Certainly in the rural areas where some of our problems 
in this regard are, oftentimes you are looking at only 
one or two landowners who adjoin the property. It's my 
view that in this day and age, people who have proper­
ty adjoining property that's going to be subdivided 
and developed have some right to be heard. We're not 
suggesting they have the right to direct the develop­
ment, but only the right to have their objections stated 
and to have a body make a decision as to whether the 
objections they have, in terms of the devaluation of the 
property and so on, are substantial enough that it 
warrants, on the appeal process, the turndown of a 
particular application. 

We touched on the two major issues involving the 
city of Edmonton. The second one involves more than 
the city of Edmonton and its concerns, Mr. Chairman. 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any further questions or 
comments? 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. MOORE: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill No. 66, 
The Planning Amendment Act, 1979, be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

MR. HORSMAN: Mr. Chairman, I would like to move 
that Bill No. 56, The Alberta Labour Amendment Act, 
1979, which has just been considered by the committee, 
be brought back before the committee for further 
consideration. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 56 
The Alberta Labour Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, until the hon. Leader of 
the Opposition can get his files and get back to the 
Assembly, perhaps it would serve a useful purpose for 
me to reiterate the main objective of Bill 56. 

I guess the best place to start would be to say that the 
construction industry in Alberta will be facing a very 
major challenge as a total industry. The objective of 
Bill 56 is to try as much as possible to normalize the 
situation with which the industry must deal on some of 
the larger projects, if the participants in the industry 
so wish. There is no question that some of the very 
large projects increase the challenge to the industry, 
not in a straight percentage rate, I think, but in terms 
of a geometric proportion. When we assemble groups 

of people in the order of 3,000, 4,000, and 5,000 in a 
construction project on a single site, that is a very 
great challenge in terms of the economic activity it 
generates. It creates side effects and after effects across 
the province, and it generates some very tremendous 
challenges in terms of manpower and recruitment of 
the specialized manpower that is necessary. It generates 
some very great challenges in terms of the labor rela­
tions on those sites. We have to respect the fact that in 
many instances we will be dealing with employees 
recruited from outside the province to assist in the 
construction of those projects for a specific period of 
time. 

Those kinds of projects are also subject to some 
pressures which do not accrue in the normal sense of 
construction as we know it; that is, the kind of pressure 
created when we all know — the construction workers 
know, and the public generally is well aware — that 
these are the sorts of projects necessary to produce a 
very essential element in terms of our national objec­
tives, in this case non-conventional oil. So they are 
subject to a series of pressures which construction in 
the normal sense does not have to deal with. 

Having in mind those very particular sets of pres­
sures and constraints, the objective of Bill 56 is to 
enable the development of a certainty, if you will, as to 
labor stability on those projects, if the parties are 
prepared and willing to do that. By so doing, I believe 
we normalize as much as possible the collective bar­
gaining scene in the construction industry. I realize 
there can be two views of that, and that it is a 
judgment decision. But if this were not the situation, I 
think the pressures on the bargaining table would be 
even greater than those pressures which accrue because 
of site legislation. 

I would very much like to have all hon. members 
keep separate and apart the pressures which arise from 
the economic activity. It's very easy to confuse the 
economic activity and the fall-out from that activity, 
which is a normal part of these large projects, with the 
specific type of labor relations scene for those projects. 

Mr. Chairman, I reviewed in some detail the main 
elements of Bill 56. I await questions at this time. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, I'd be remiss if I didn't 
say to you and to the minister that I appreciate bring­
ing the Bill back. My only excuse was that I was 
speaking to the municipal leaders of the province at 
the municipal convention. 

First of all, Mr. Chairman, as I indicated on second 
reading, I am not enthused about this piece of legisla­
tion. Frankly, Mr. Minister, I had hoped that the offi­
cials of the Department of Labour and you would be 
able to come to some conclusion other than carve-out 
legislation, if I can use that term. I think it would be 
really important if, in the few minutes available for the 
Bill this afternoon, we could get some indication of the 
kind of discussion process the minister went through. 

I'll be very frank. We sat down with the Alberta 
construction group. I'd say at the outset that we were 
very impressed with their sincerity, recognizing that 
they see the problems from a somewhat different point 
of view than the government does. I believe they sat 
down with the government MLAs — I'm sure they met 
with the minister — and explained their concern. One 
of the portions of their presentation that impressed me 
very much was their attempt to look at what happened 
in the Syncrude carve-out, then to try to take the 
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conclusions from there and apply them to a third or 
fourth plant. I think it's important to recognize that 
those conclusions were perhaps more difficult to draw 
out, if I might use that term, because of the imposition 
of the national wage and price guidelines. 

Mr. Minister, could you indicate to the House the 
kinds of options that were considered and the kinds of 
discussions that went on? I can very reluctantly buy this 
approach, I suppose, if I am convinced that it's the last 
alternative. But I'm very hopeful that the minister and 
his department would have been able to work out some 
type of approach other than the carve-out, if I could use 
the term. 

MR. YOUNG: First of all, Mr. Chairman, to respond 
on the process. I had anticipated that it would be a very 
difficult decision to make. In April, and I think it fair 
to say April because I wasn't in office much before that, 
I commenced meetings with all sectors of the industry 
— union, non-union, international contractors, gener­
al contractors, subcontractors — as many different in­
terest groups as I could contact. I indicated to them 
that a difficult decision had to be made, and that in 
view of its difficulty I thought we would proceed on 
the basis of a two-part decision-making structure. First 
of all, I would ask all parties to the industry and all 
interested parties to examine the question of whether or 
not the construction industry, given that there may be 
a development of the nature that we can contemplate, 
which is Alsands, the Cold Lake project, or a variety of 
others, whatever the industry participants might fore­
see — given that possibility, did there need to be 
special legislation? Without the former Bill 52 or Bill 
56, would The Alberta Labour Act as it now stands be 
adequate to serve the needs and interests of the partici­
pants in the construction industry? If the answer would 
be that there should be some particular legislation, 
please indicate to me what the preference would be. 
Once I had a good view of and had participated in a 
discussion of that nature with the different sectors in 
the industry, I would then arrive at some kind of 
decision as to yes or no, there would or wouldn't be 
special legislation. If the answer was yes, the general 
direction we were thinking, and ask for input to make 
that particular direction as best we could fashion it. 

That's the process that was followed. I don't mind 
saying I had many, many, many meetings, briefs, and 
submissions. We examined all the different possibilities 
that could be dreamt up. I think the Alberta Construc­
tion Labour Relations Association itself presented five 
or six different alternatives. I could go into them; they 
ranged all the way from, no, we didn't need any special 
legislation — I think that clearly would be one of their 
preferred alternatives — to subjects such as the Loren-
ville project in New Brunswick, that kind of approach. 
At the bottom line I think it's fair to say we concluded, 
as is obvious, that there should be some special 
legislation. 

We reviewed with the participants the various alter­
natives brought forward. I think the best response I 
can make to the hon. Leader of the Opposition is that 
either there is special legislation which in the first 
sense is optional — the parties may or may not. That is, 
there has to be good will within the industry; that's a 
prerequisite to the success of any special legislation. So 
it had to be made optional. 

Secondly, I think it would be fair to say that many 
suggestions from outside Alberta, experiments that 

have been tried elsewhere, may not have been that 
successful even where they were tried. Certainly in the 
Alberta context, which is considerably different from 
some places — the history, the background, and the 
perception the parties have of the situation — we felt it 
was not suitable; it couldn't be grafted onto the Alberta 
situation and work that well. 

We then went to the old legislation, Bill 52, and 
tried to examine that in terms of modifications that 
could be made to remove some of what I would like to 
identify as the greatest problems. In my view one of the 
greatest problems was the understanding in the indus­
try. I don't wish to be unfair to any parties, but the fact 
of the matter is that the legislation came in late. Some 
commitments were made, and it then made it very diffi­
cult to avoid certain types of misunderstandings, espe­
cially having in mind the tremendous steps that have 
been made by way of tripartite consultation in the 
construction industry — there is some very major 
progress in that respect. We thought we should try to 
build on that and at the same time try to assure that we 
keep moving in that direction. 

So we think the process of application for designa­
tion, the procedure and opportunity for discussion with 
interested parties of various facets of that potential 
designation, will remove some of the concerns which 
arose from the Syncrude experience and will keep a 
freer flow of information within the industry and a 
better sense of co-operation, if I may use that 
expression. 

Maybe I should stop there and see if that answers at 
least part of the question. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, to the minister: yes, 
the first part. 

The second part dealt with the attempt by the Alberta 
Construction Labour Relations Association to do an 
assessment of the Syncrude project, and the impact that 
this carve-out in fact had. I will just pose the next 
question, Mr. Minister. It seemed to me that here we 
have a group that attempted to evaluate the effects in, I 
think, a pretty realistic way. It seemed to me that in 
light of the legislation going this way, it would be 
extremely worth while for the department to, if I could 
use the word, contract out a group to do an assessment 
of the impact of this particular approach. 

As I indicated in my earlier question, I think the 
impact of wage and price controls certainly changed 
the dynamics as far as the Syncrude venture was con­
cerned. Mr. Minister, I think it would be a very positive 
step and would be building on what I'd like to refer to 
as bridges of understanding between the industry, the 
government, the union, and other construction 
groups in the province if in fact the minister caused 
some of the universities or some consulting firm that 
has some understanding of what's involved here to do 
an assessment: of the impact during the course of the 
Cold Lake or the Alsands project. 

It seems to me, Mr. Minister, that a logical thing 
would be to come back and have a look at that work. 
I'm not suggesting that that kind of assessment 
would take hundreds of thousands of dollars; I don't 
think that would be necessary at all. But if it could be 
seen as a third party, because I was impressed with the 
work done there in an attempt to do that kind of 
assessment. As I pointed out in our discussions with 
them, there is some question as to how objective they 
are, too. And I make that point with the very best 
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intention. Is the minister prepared to consider that kind 
of independent appraisal, if I might use that term? 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, perhaps I should add a 
bit to what I've already described as to what we tried to 
do, and reflect upon — I'm sure the hon. Leader of the 
Opposition knows that the Alberta Construction La­
bour Relations Association did contract with Professors 
Jenkins and Riddell at the university to analyse at least 
two points as best they could in terms of the impact of 
Bill 52 on the Syncrude project. 

The first point they were to look at was the impact of 
the no-strike, no-lockout agreement on strike activity. 
The conclusion the professors arrived at was that be­
cause of the lack of data, the short time frame, and all 
the other variables that feed on it, it was not possible to 
arrive at any objective, non-debatable conclusions. So 
there was no conclusion that the Bill did in fact have 
any impact on strike activity, and I really think that's as 
we might expect. I really think it would be difficult to 
show that a Bill of that nature produces more strikes in 
other facets of the industry. That's conditioned as much 
by attitudes and economic events, I think, as by any­
thing else. 

The second item they looked at was the impact of 
that Bill on wage settlements during the period, and 
they concluded that it did have an upward effect. But 
what they don't deal with, and here we get into a 
statistical debate, is a fact which I think is pretty 
fundamental and, to me, is the overriding piece of 
evidence if one looks at the wage rates for three trades 
in 1970, 1975, and 1979 — I believe they are plumbers, 
electricians, and carpenters which I have examined — 
and looks at union rates in three different centres, 
Vancouver, Edmonton, and Toronto. In 1970 Toronto 
had the highest union hourly wage rate for all three 
trades; by 1979 Toronto was still the highest. In 1970 
Vancouver was in second spot; Vancouver is now in 
third spot and Edmonton is in second spot. So there 
was a shifting of position. 

But again, if we have regard to the level of econom­
ic activity that prevailed in Alberta, certainly as op­
posed to Vancouver — Toronto had a fair amount of 
construction, but it did not have the boom Alberta did 
— we would expect that in order to attract tradespeople 
we would have made some wage gain. Relatively 
speaking, some wage gain was made, but it wasn't 
what I would consider unexpected or out of the way. I 
think what they did was identify that in fact there was a 
relative change, and I think we should expect a relative 
change. So I have to say that while I respect the 
professors' efforts and acknowledge the impact of the 
wage controls in effect during that period, I am not 
surprised at their conclusions and would accept them as 
a normal part of the expected spinoff from the econom­
ic activity. 

With respect to further analysis, I really believe it's a 
pretty subjective area. It might be interesting for all 
hon. members to know that in the industry we have the 
Alberta Construction Industry Industrial Relations 
Council, which is made up of three government repre­
sentatives — I'm the chairman of it — three senior trade 
union representatives, and representatives from the con­
tractors and from the owners. A C L R A has two repre­
sentatives on that council. It meets approximately 
monthly. 

Among the other activities it is engaged in is a 
critique of major construction projects in this province, 

the most recent being Syncrude. We were just conclud­
ing our critique of the Syncrude project when this 
legislation came along. We examined many different 
aspects of Syncrude: how it was carried out, the labor 
relations program, the training of apprentices, the 
involvement of local labor and the opportunities for 
that, camp conditions. I believe some 50 different items 
are examined in terms of that critique. 

You can imagine that by meeting monthly we got 
to be fairly familiar with one another, so the level of 
open discussion is now very high. As a consequence, 
when we did get to the impact of the legislation we 
had some fairly free discussions. So free, that those 
discussions then went on to question what we were 
proposing by way of legislation. In fact, the legisla­
tion in the broad concept was first discussed at that 
table. It was then discussed in somewhat greater detail, 
although not nearly in the detail of the Bill here. But 
what I would call the fundamental package was all 
there in principle. Those principles were discussed, and 
A C L R A was part of that discussion. I'm pleased to be 
able to report that while we did not have unanimity, I 
believe it fair to say that the preponderance was suppor­
tive of the position we're taking. 

Perhaps it would be useful and a good opportunity 
for me while I have the floor to reflect to hon. members 
that a task force in the industry has come up with a 
bargaining approach for the industry. On October 4, I 
believe, in Red Deer, fairly unanimous agreement was 
determined on a new approach which, in my view, 
would be very effective in eliminating some of the 
strikes which occurred in the last two rounds of collec­
tive bargaining, particularly in the construction in­
dustry. The proposition in a nutshell is that as all save 
one of the collective agreements of the 17 trades expire 
at the same time — that one expires one month later, as 
I recollect — they will all commence bargaining at the 
same time. The Department of Labour will make avail­
able our regular conciliating staff, who will be there 
on an as-needed basis. They will operate within certain 
time frames. At a point in time the parties, labor and 
management, have agreed that we will insert in the 
bargaining process our conciliation staff. They will 
then begin to function as conciliators. By the time the 
collective agreement expires, the agreements will ei­
ther have been signed or the parties will be in a 
position legally to either strike or lock out. 

All parties in the industry are of the same mind, that 
it is very important to improve the productivity of the 
industry, and very important to improve the public 
perception of the industry as well — I think that would 
be a fair comment. We believe we can improve produc­
tivity by the fact that we don't have a series of sequen­
tial strikes, with one trade bringing down a project or 
at least hampering it by going out on strike or being 
upset about the bargaining process. 

While it isn't industry-wide bargaining, it's get­
ting very close to it. It's done by mutual agreement. It 
is our hope that on that basis the industry will police 
itself. This is what they have committed themselves to 
do, police themselves so hopefully they will arrive at 
collective agreements without difficulty. If they don't, 
the difficulties will occur in a very short time frame and 
the industry will be settled down and able to work full 
out for the duration of the collective agreements. 

Heretofore our experience has been that there have 
been a series of breakdowns in collective bargaining, a 
series of work stoppages. A work stoppage of one 
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trade severely hampers and pulls down the productivity 
of all other trades, because you get a lot of down time, 
a lot of upset, and a lot of rescheduling; it causes all 
kinds of extra costs. That's what we're working to 
now. Given that as a very real approach to be tried in 
1980, I would think that, especially if that approach 
carries on, any comparisons with what may have hap­
pened under other legislation would be different be­
cause we have a totally different perception and com­
mitment on the part of the representatives of industry 
themselves to try to make, if you will, a much better 
labor relations scene in the province. 

So while I'm not adverse to the kind of study you 
mention, it is so subjective and has so many other 
variables — I mentioned the one very large variable 
that I would see impacting upon it — that I really 
don't know what value it would be and what informa­
tion of a non-debatable nature it would generate in the 
present circumstances. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, just one last comment 
to the minister. As I indicated initially, I'm not by any 
stretch of the imagination wildly enthusiastic about 
this legislation. I certainly think it would be far better 
if we didn't have to bring this legislation forward. 

Mr. Minister, I would simply like to make this point. 
It seems to me that for the last megaproject — if I 
could use the term — in the province we went the route 
of the predecessor to Bill 56, 52 I guess it was. Now on 
the next possible megaproject we're going this route 
here. The situation we're now in is that the cabinet will 
have the legislative mandate. Once an application is 
made to the cabinet by the parties, the cabinet will be in 
a position to make the decision whether any heavy oil 
or tar sands project, not only in northeastern Alberta 
but in the Wabasca-Desmarais area and over to the 
Peace River country in the future, will be subject to this 
kind of legislation. 

I can see it may well be that on a project like the 
pipeline coming down from the north, the govern­
ment will be requested to have a special piece of legis­
lation possibly in effect. The real point I'm trying to 
make, Mr. Minister, is I think that what we're doing by 
the former piece of legislation and this piece of legis­
lation is that for any huge project in the province, 
we're really saying, look, our Labour Act doesn't suf­
fice, and we're prepared to carve it out. Now in essence 
we have carved out all the heavy oil or oil sands 
projects from here on with this piece of legislation, 
really without attempting to have — if I can use the 
term — an independent look at the impact. Now I 
recognize, Mr. Minister, there can be different assess­
ments of the impact. We can become involved every day 
in the Assembly here on arguments as to what's factual 
and what isn't. 

My plea is this: now we're to a stage where every tar 
sands project, every heavy oil plant project is carved 
out, despite the fact that it may be difficult in making 
the judgment I think it would be worth while to 
attempt to have some independent group make a 
judgment. If I can be so frank, Mr. Minister, it's 
somewhat like your department or our office making a 
judgment on the effectiveness. To some extent, it's a 
matter of looking at it from the eyes of the beholder, 
isn't it? I can see that a number of subjective judg­
ments are involved in that kind of assessment, Mr. 
Minister. But I still would make the point that I think 
an attempt to have an independent look, at least at the 

next plant that comes along, would be extremely 
helpful. 

I would ask you, Mr. Minister, to reconsider what I 
hope is not a decision but a feeling at this time, and 
that over the next period of time you may feel moved to 
move in that direction. I think it would be very worth 
while, given the fact that we've now carved out all the 
heavy oil plants. Also the attitude of industry being 
what it is, on other megaprojects which come down 
the pike I would think the tendency there would be to 
say, look, this is the route we've gone on heavy oil 
plants; why shouldn't we look at a carved-out route 
here? I think somewhat of an independent assessment 
would be valuable not only to the department, Mr. 
Minister, and to the Legislature, and likely valuable 
not only for some labor peace, but also it would be the 
kind of information that would be very good to be able 
to have available for groups like the Alberta Construc­
tion Labour Relations group, who albeit represent ba­
sically smaller contracting firms — well, I agree, Mr. 
Minister, yes and no; but at least Alberta- and 
Canadian-based to a very great degree, let's put it that 
way — as opposed to a point of view that I'm sure 
comes to the minister from Bechtel and groups like 
that, who are much more worldly, one can use the term, 
from the standpoint of being involved in projects like 
this all around the world. 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, I'd just like to reflect on 
two or three comments that were made. First of all, I 
wouldn't wish to leave the impression that this legisla­
tion will automatically be applied to all the non-
conventional, heavy oil plant construction projects, if I 
can use that expression. It won't be applied 
automatically. 

MR. R. C L A R K : The route is there for the 
applications. 

MR. YOUNG: That is right. The owners may apply, 
but there may well be some circumstances when they 
would not qualify for that possibility. 

I would have to think long and hard about any 
project that wasn't of a duration that at least went 
beyond the time frame of a collective agreement, which 
in the construction industry is normally two years, and 
that didn't involve a fairly large number of employees 
during that time as well — to use just two criteria. 

The old legislation did allow an automatic possibili­
ty to any additions to plants. In fact, the Great Cana­
dian Oil Sands addition, which can be completed in 
less than two years and which I understand isn't 
going to exceed more than a couple of hundred mil­
lion, is going to be able to avail itself of the old 
legislation. I believe. 

In future, that kind of project would be looked at 
pretty carefully, because it would be the objective not to 
allow so many projects that there's a possibility of 
destroying the collective bargaining table which 
would normally prevail in the industry. Whatever else, 
there has to be some opportunity there for both parties 
to try to arrive at a mutual agreement as to what the 
wage, salaries, and working conditions should be. 
That is really what we're trying to protect. There's a 
difference in judgment as to the best way of doing it, 
and I acknowledge that. But at the bottom line, that is 
one of the objectives I have for this legislation. 

With respect to the independent assessment, while 
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not committing myself to undertake that, I would 
again remind the hon. Leader of the Opposition that I 
do hope to maintain the tripartite council, the Con­
struction Industry Industrial Relations Council, and I 
would expect that it will be watching what's happen­
ing fairly closely and would raise questions or con­
cerns. I know, and I'm sure the hon. leader is aware too, 
that the Alberta Construction Labour Relations Asso­
ciation made a number of pieces of information availa­
ble. In fact, they generated a great deal of research for 
my attention. I have to say it was all carefully read, and 
we did some research on our own within the depart­
ment to serve, if you will, as an independent reference 
to some conclusions they arrived at on their main 
concerns. 

I would also indicate that Alberta is so significant in 
the construction scene now that the Canadian executive 
board of the construction unions is having a sharp eye 
on what happens in Alberta, and I have had meetings 
with them in Alberta. I am sure they, along with the 
Canadian Construction Association, are looking very 
closely at the legislation and will be following the use 
of that legislation, the evolution of it, very closely. 

So I think it fair to say that I will be reviewing the 
legislation on a fairly continuing basis, whether I like 
it or not, just to try to be assured that what we in fact 
are doing, will, under the various situations that may 
arise, prove to be the best resolution of a very difficult 
challenge. I'm happy to give that undertaking; I'm 
sure it's going to happen as a matter of course. 

I'll consider the independent assessment, because I 
don't know who, in this issue, is truly independent, 
given that there have been a number of studies of the 
construction industry by the various experts in Canada 
in the labor relations field. Many of them have been 
involved in one way or another in studies of the con­
struction industry, and I think most of them would 
bring to the table various predispositions one way or 
another. But we'll continue to monitor that and ex­
amine its feasibility and desirability. But in closing, 
Mr. Chairman, I am sure there are enough interested 
parties that any single concern they have will be iden­
tified to my attention very early on. 

MR. M A C K : Mr. Chairman, I feel compelled to make a 
few comments. As recently as last week I had a meeting 
with three major representatives of major trade groups. 
They requested the meeting primarily on this particu­
lar matter. I have also been in a couple of meetings 
with representatives of A C L R A and have had the op­
portunity to assess the concerns they have expressed. I 
felt that some of their concerns may have some merit, 
particularly those that indicated there was a shift of 
tradespeople from one project to another during a job 
action. In communicating with the various major 
trades, I posed the question: when there is a job action, 
is there actually a shift of a group of people on a 
weekly basis to the major project on the megaproject, 
for example, where there is the carve-out agreement? 
They clearly indicated that this did not occur, certainly 
not on the organized basis that had been indicated to 
us. 

The other aspect we had in our discussions with 
representatives of A C L R A is that I had asked them the 
question: since there is only approximately 30 per cent 
of that particular construction industry that's or­
ganized and 70 per cent unorganized, what impact 
would private entrepreneurs in that particular field 

have on the construction field during job action of a 
particular trade? They had not addressed that question. 
I submit to you, Mr. Chairman, and to hon. members 
that that aspect was either overlooked — and I can't 
imagine it being overlooked, because it really does 
play a major role in the overall. Where do people go 
when a service withdrawal or a strike occurs on a 
particular jobsite? As tradesmen they either do things 
on their own which they can do on part-time jobs, or 
they go to the private entrepreneur who obviously 
would be able to take on more work during that 
particular period of time. But the representatives of 
A C L R A indicated that that was a question they did not 
assess and really had very little analysis of, which we 
believe does play a very major role in the impact as far 
as absorbing people is concerned. 

The other is that people don't necessarily stay within 
their trade during a situation of this nature. Those 
who in fact do go and work elsewhere during job 
action will go into any type of employment. Certainly, 
although the concern raised by A C L R A representatives 
that in fact a carve-out agreement on a major mega­
project is aiding and abetting the difficulty in arriv­
ing at an acceptable agreement with groups or trades 
that would be out on strike, when you take a look at the 
total sum it just does not equate. 

I commend the hon. minister for going into great 
detail in explaining the research that he and his de­
partment conducted, the various meetings they have 
had in attempting to show sincere appreciation of real 
concern of what a carve-out project may do in the 
overall scene. I think it's very forward planning on the 
part of the government, at least to provide particularly 
those very, very costly projects some labor peace and 
stabilization, particularly if they have had the ability to 
get at least passive acquiescence if not elated acquies­
cence to the major trades on this project. It would 
appear to me that basically it would go against the 
normal labor practice to agree voluntarily to adopt a 
carve-out project. Yet I believe the kind of experience 
and the kinds of leaders we have in the province of 
Alberta on the labor side recognize the difficulties, that 
one trade actually affects the other by having whip-
sawing of one going off one week and another group 
going off another week. 

I felt compelled that I should add to the debate, Mr. 
Chairman, that I support the Bill. I think it's innova­
tive, forward planning. I think it will prove to be very 
effective in the province of Alberta in terms of saving 
many hundreds of thousands of dollars for major 
employers and employees as well. 

Thank you. 

MR. HORSMAN: Mr. Chairman, I move the commit­
tee rise, report progress, and beg leave to sit again. 

[Motion carried] 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, might I pose 
through you, sir, to the Government House Leader the 
possibility of, once the hour is over, our using until 
5:30 for government business. We on this side of the 
House would certainly be agreeable if that's agreeable 
with the government. 

MR. HORSMAN: Yes, Mr. Chairman. It was our inten­
tion to extend the time, but we have no option but to 
proceed this way in view of the rules. 
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MR. C H A I R M A N : For information I have to point out 
that in order to extend our time we would have to have 
direction from the Assembly. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Let's get so directed then. 

[Mr. Speaker in the Chair] 

MR. APPLEBY: Mr. Speaker, the Committee of the 
Whole Assembly has had under consideration and re­
ports Bills 47, 53, and 66. Also the committee reports 
progress on Bill 56. 

MR. SPEAKER: Having heard the report, do you all 
agree? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

MR. HORSMAN: Mr. Speaker, I move that the rules be 
suspended in order that the remainder of the afternoon 
until 5:30 be devoted to government business. 

MR. SPEAKER: The motion of the hon. deputy leader 
requires unanimous consent. Is there any dissent in the 
Assembly? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

[On motion, the Assembly resolved itself into Commit­
tee of the Whole] 

[Mr. Appleby in the Chair] 

MR. C H A I R M A N : The Committee of the Whole As­
sembly will please come to order once again. We'll 
continue with our discussion of Bill 56. The hon. 
Member for Bonnyville wishes to comment. 

MR. ISLEY: Thank you, Mr. Chairman. I would like 
to speak in support of Bill 56 as a representative of a 
constituency that may have a megaproject. I think I 
also speak for the people of the local area who may be 
affected. 

In supporting it, I would say the following: I've 
listened to the arguments put forward by the pro­
ponent of the project as to why there should be such 
legislation; I've listened to the arguments against it 
by the construction industry, with respect to the impact 
it has on wages and strike havens. However, my major 
reason for supporting it and, I believe, the major 
reason the people in the area feel it is necessary have 
more to do with the social implications of labor unrest. 
I think we all agree that the communities will have 
their hands full gearing up for the boom, preparing 
services, and developing recreational facilities. The last 
thing we should foist upon the local people are a lot of 
workers who have idle time as a result of strike 
situations. 

With that, Mr. Chairman, I support Bill 56. 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, I gather you're very 
close to calling the question. If I could just say to the 
hon. Member for Edmonton Belmont and the hon. 
Member for Bonnyville that I appreciate their com­
ments, and use this opportunity to express the appre­
ciation I have for the number of participants who have 
been involved in trying to sort out what is potentially 
the best approach to these megaprojects. We have had 

the co-operation of well over 20 different groups in the 
construction industry, all of whom I believe I have met 
with and most, if not all, of whom have presented 
submissions to us as a department. Some, including 
the Alberta and Northwest Territories Building and 
Construction Trades Council and the Alberta Construc­
tion Labour Relations Association, have met on more 
than one occasion, sometimes on many occasions. 

It has not been an easy piece of legislation to 
develop. I do believe that all parties have shown a 
tremendous sense of responsibility to the industry as a 
whole. They recognize the challenge to the industry, 
and I am very optimistic about the positive approach 
which I believe all will take. Despite misgivings that 
some may have, I have been assured that they will 
endeavor to do their very best to make this legislation 
work for the success of the industry in the challenges 
which confront it. 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any further questions or 
comments on Bill 56? This Bill was reintroduced to the 
committee, so we'll follow the procedure of approval 
once again. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, I move that the Bill be 
reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 34 
The Teachers' Retirement Fund 

Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : There is an amendment to Bill 34, 
which is now being circulated to all hon. members. 
Would there be any questions or comments with respect 
to the amendment? 

MR. D. ANDERSON: If I might briefly make some 
comments with respect to the amendment. It's not a 
significant one; it merely crosses out the term 
"full-time" in the current section relating to those 
persons who might be able to take advantage of the 
Teachers' Retirement Fund. This is done primarily to 
allow those operators of early childhood services, who 
in fact are very often half-time individuals, to contrib­
ute to the fund and therefore receive benefits from it. 
That's the only ramification of this amendment. I be­
lieve it is not important. I would like to move that that 
amendment be accepted. 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any other questions or 
comments regarding the amendment? 

[Motion on amendment carried] 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Now we'll consider the amended 
Bill No. 34. Are there any questions or comments with 
respect to the Bill? Does the sponsor wish to make a 
statement? 

MR. D. ANDERSON: Mr. Chairman, I don't think I 
could make many more remarks than already indicated 
during second reading of this Bill. The first and 
second changes are merely definition changes in order 
to bring the Bill up to date. The third change is one 
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which would make it easier for teachers with respect to 
the registered retirement savings plan; the fourth, in 
terms of the transferability of the plan; the fifth, again, 
in terms of bringing it up to date; and the final one 
ensuring that the board, when determining the bene­
fits of that particular fund, has an opportunity to take 
into account contributions a teacher makes, if they're 
not full contributions. 

I would have no other comments, Mr. Chairman, but 
would be more than willing, as I'm sure the minister 
would, who's not here, to answer questions. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. D. ANDERSON: Mr. Chairman, I move that the 
Bill as amended be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 57 
The Oil and Gas 

Conservation Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments with respect to this Bill? 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill No. 57, 
The Oil and Gas Conservation Amendment Act, 1979, 
be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 59 
The Petroleum Marketing 

Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments? 

MR. LEITCH: Thank you, Mr. Chairman. I would like 
to make a brief comment because I noticed on check­
ing Hansard that I left an incorrect impression with 
the Legislative Assembly during second reading. I 
referred to the Petroleum Marketing Commission as 
purchasing, when what I really meant to say was that 
it took delivery. The Petroleum Marketing Commis­
sion is not really a purchaser; it's an agent for the sale 
of Crown production, which is that volume of produc­
tion determined by royalty levels, and the agent for the 
sale of the lessee's portion of the production. During 
second reading I inadvertently referred to the commis­
sion purchasing when actually I had in mind the 
commission taking possession. 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any other questions or 
comments? 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill No. 59, 
The Petroleum Marketing Amendment Act, 1979, be 
reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 60 
The Natural Gas Pricing 

Agreement Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments respecting this Bill? 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, I thought this would 
be an appropriate time to ask the minister if he could 
bring us up to date as to where the discussions are 
between Alberta and a number of the other provinces, 
especially with regard to Part 2.1 of the Act. Market 
Development. If my memory is accurate, I believe it was 
last week that considerable public comment was made, 
not only by some people from the Petroleum Market­
ing Commission but also from some people who were, 
shall I say, less than wildly enthusiastic about shifting 
from oil to natural gas — the province of Ontario. So 
this may be an appropriate time to get an updating as 
to where those discussions are. 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Chairman, without repeating ex­
tensively the comments I made on second reading, I 
can just briefly review the present situation. The con­
cept of an incentive natural gas pricing scheme was 
introduced and agreed to at the first ministers' meet­
ing, I believe in November 1978. Since that time, we've 
been working on a plan that we thought would be the 
best from Alberta's point of view, and the most accept­
able to other provinces. We had proposed a reduction 
in the price of new volumes, or additional volumes, of 
natural gas to 75 per cent of parity, as opposed to the 
price of 85 per cent of parity with oil, which is applica­
ble to the now-flowing volumes of natural gas. 

Submissions have been made to us, notably by the 
province of Quebec, that that reduction in price was 
not large enough to push out oil in that province. 
They provided us with some studies in support of their 
position. We have reviewed those, and have not reached 
a final decision as to what price reduction might be 
required to push out the significant volumes of oil that 
we are contemplating. When I say push out oil, Mr. 
Chairman, I'm really referring to displacing oil that is 
now being used for heating purposes and things of 
that nature. 

This is part of the discussions we are continuing 
with the federal government with respect to energy, 
because there may be a role in this plan for the federal 
government. That has not yet been determined. There 
are references to an incentive natural gas plan in the 
document tabled in the House today and tabled by the 
federal government in the federal House last night. 

To sum up in a sentence where we are at the 
moment, I would say we're in negotiations, with both 
the other provinces and the federal government. As to 
when those negotiations might end, I simply couldn't 
predict, Mr. Chairman. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Minister, what's the position of 
the government of Alberta with regard to who is to 
pick up the difference between the 85 per cent BTU 
equivalent and Alberta's position, as I understand it, of 
75 per cent, to — I think the minister used the term — 
push out oil in the province of Quebec. The figures 
I've seen indicate the province of Quebec is talking in 
terms of 65 per cent. Any ballpark figures, Mr. Minis­
ter, as to the number of dollars involved at 75 per cent 
— the Alberta government's position? What kind of 

*

*See page 1105, left column, paragraph 9 and right column, paragraph 1
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funds are we talking of, on the bottom line, whether 
that amount of money comes from Alberta, from a 
combination of the Alberta government and producers, 
or from the federal government in the course of any tax 
that may be imposed? What kind of figures are we 
looking at? And, Mr. Minister, would you be in a 
position to give some indication to the committee as to 
the magnitude of the impact this could have, from the 
standpoint of how many barrels of oil we hope to free 
up for higher priority use if we're successful, one, in 
negotiating a scheme here and, secondly, in having 
the push-out effect? 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Chairman, there were a number of 
questions there. The first was, who would bear the 
difference — really, the loss of revenue — between the 
85 per cent and such lower percentage as these new 
volumes of gas may be sold for? The answer is that it 
would be borne in total by the Alberta producers, and 
by the provincial government in the sense that it 
would receive a smaller royalty. So we've not been 
talking about a contribution by the federal govern­
ment or others with respect to that difference. If the 
federal government is involved, it would be in the area 
of transportation, as opposed to the selling price of the 
natural gas. The legislation here would authorize the 
Petroleum Marketing Commission to accumulate the 
fund that would lead to the reduced price, and then 
distribute that fund to the distribution companies in 
the various provinces. The distribution companies 
would use that as they saw fit to increase their sales. 

The prime reason for our reaching the conclusion 
that that was the best plan was simply that any other 
plans had us involved, in one way or another, in 
determining the price at the burner tip in other prov­
inces, or determining the price of natural gas in other 
provinces so far as the consumer is concerned. In our 
view, that would be getting involved in their jurisdic­
tion. So the short answer to the question is that the cost 
of the reduced revenues would be borne pro rata by 
Alberta producers, in accordance with their volumes of 
production. 

I think it important to keep in mind that the whole 
matter of gas sales and gas pricing is a package, and 
we can't look at each little part of it in isolation. From 
that point of view, we need to keep in mind that the 
difference between the 85 per cent, which is the Cana­
dian price of natural gas, and the export price at which 
we're selling to the United States — which is a very 
significant difference, very large sums of money in­
volved there — all flows back to the Petroleum Market­
ing Commission, and through them to the producers 
in Alberta. So we can't look at this totally in isolation. 
Members of the committee will be aware that, unlike 
oil, we have no export tax on natural gas. 

The hon. Leader of the Opposition asked me for two 
other estimates: one, what this reduced revenue might 
total and, secondly, the volumes of oil that might be 
pushed out by an incentive natural gas pricing screen. 
The two are, of course, tied together, because the more 
oil you push out the larger the volumes of gas you're 
selling, and the larger the size of the reduced revenues 
between the 85 per cent and whatever price this incen­
tive natural gas might be priced at. 

The estimates in both those areas would vary quite 
significantly, depending on who is doing the estim­
ate, and on how far east in Canada we would extend the 
natural gas transmission system. It'll be one number if 

we extend it only to Quebec, and a somewhat larger 
number if we extend it to the Atlantic provinces. But in 
round numbers, Mr. Chairman, I think we can talk of 
$500 million by way of the difference in revenue over 
about nine years, which would be the lifetime of the 
program as we now envisage it, and in the order of 
100,000 barrels of oil per day, perhaps somewhat high­
er, being displaced by these additional volumes of 
natural gas. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, to the minister. Are 
any negotiations going on now with the various 
maritime provinces? 

MR. LEITCH: Active negotiations are not going on 
now with the maritime provinces. They of course are 
interested in getting natural gas, but there is the very 
major question of the cost of the transportation facility 
to get it from Quebec City, if the line were extended to 
Quebec City, to the Atlantic provinces. So we're hav­
ing discussions with the federal government about 
this entire energy package. That part of the plan is a 
component of those- discussions, but we haven't been 
actively negotiating with the Atlantic provinces on 
this aspect of the proposal. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Minister, is the extension of the 
pipeline from Quebec City, to use the minister's ex­
ample, to the maritimes the kind of thing that might 
very well fit under the energy bank kind of discussions, 
or whatever federal term is in vogue today, to see us 
move to national self-sufficiency? Is this the kind of 
thing the federal government in essence could put 
quite a bit of money into? Does the minister see the 
federal government having a role to play in that kind 
of extension? 

MR. LEITCH: In the various discussions about the 
energy bank, Mr. Chairman, the financing of these 
transportation facilities has been discussed as an area in 
which the bank might be involved. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. LEITCH: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill No. 60, 
The Natural Gas Pricing Agreement Amendment Act, 
1979, be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 75 
The Trust Companies Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. C H A I R M A N : Are there any questions, comments, 
or amendments? 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. O M A N : Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill No. 75, 
The Trust Companies Amendment Act, 1979, be 
reported. 

[Motion carried] 

MR. HORSMAN: Mr. Chairman, I move that the 
committee rise, report progress, and beg leave to sit 
again. 
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[Motion carried] 

[Mr. Speaker in the Chair] 

MR. APPLEBY: Mr. Speaker, the Committee of the 
Whole Assembly has had under consideration and re­
ports the following Bills: 56, 57, 59, 60, and 75. The 
committee has also had under consideration and reports 
with some amendments Bill No. 34. 

MR. SPEAKER: Having heard the report, do you all 
agree? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

head: GOVERNMENT BILLS AND ORDERS 
(Second Reading) 

Bill 35 
The Alberta Heritage Savings Trust Fund 

Special Appropriation Act, 1980-81 

MR. H Y N D M A N : Mr. Speaker, I move second reading 
of Bill No. 35. 

This Bill is a short piece of legislation. Its purpose is 
to continue the flow of 30 per cent of the non­
renewable resource revenue of the province into the 
Heritage Savings Trust Fund during the period April 
1, 1980, to March 31, 1981, pursuant to Section 5 of The 
Alberta Heritage Savings Trust Fund Act. 

Very simply, I would urge hon. members to vote for 
this Bill and thereby continue the flow of these re­
venues into the Heritage Savings Trust Fund, so that 
we can continue to build this unique savings account 
for future generations. I would welcome the views of 
members on all matters relating to the fund and to the 
Bill. 

[Motion carried; Bill 35 read a second time] 

Bill 77 
The Alberta Heritage Savings 

Trust Fund Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. H Y N D M A N : Mr. Speaker, I move second reading 
of Bill No. 77. 

This Bill is straightforward and contains essentially 
two elements. Firstly, it adds flexibility to the Alberta 
investment division of the fund in that it opens options 
which are not now available with respect to future 
investments. Members will recall that with respect to 
investments in this division of the fund in the past, two 
tests had to be met in addition to the test of yielding a 
reasonable return or profit: any investment contemplat­
ed for that division had to meet the test of strengthen­
ing as well as diversifying the Alberta economy. That 
has been satisfactory over the last two or three years, but 
I submit to hon. members that the fund has now 
reached a new stage of maturity. We have to consider 
broadening this provision of the Act by amending it 
to read that such an investment could strengthen or 
diversify the Alberta economy. 

Mr. Speaker, an example of the need for or desirabili­
ty of greater flexibility relates to the fact that the two 
key elements or foundation stones of the Alberta 
economy today remain agriculture and energy, even 
though we are in the process of diversification. There­

fore it would seem desirable that it be possible to make 
investments under this division that would purely 
strengthen the agriculture area of the province, or 
purely strengthen the economy through an energy 
investment, because some might suggest that that's 
not meeting the test of diversification. I believe it's 
important in the years ahead to have this flexibility for 
that division of the fund, so that investments could be 
made which only strengthen and may or may not 
diversify the fund. 

In closing, I would only add in respect of this 
element of the Bill that that was one of the recommen­
dations of the select committee, the report of which was 
tabled in the Assembly just recently. It was one of the 
very straightforward recommendations capable of 
quick action. 

Mr. Speaker, the second proposal made in the Bill is 
to clarify, by an amendment, the breadth of review of 
the committee. The committee, as set forth with respect 
to the parameters in Section 13(3) as it now reads, can 
review and report concerning the investments of the 
fund. I think it has always been contemplated that that 
review and report would relate not only to existing 
investments but to possible future alternative invest­
ments as well. There was a recommendation of the 
committee to that effect. The second purpose of this 
Bill is to implement that very useful recommendation. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Speaker, might I just make two 
comments with regard to second reading of this Bill. 
Dealing with the last matter the Provincial Treasurer 
raised, that of the question of the review of the select 
committee, I welcome the amendment in that area. I 
think it's very appropriate. 

Secondly, Mr. Speaker, I'd like to deal with the first 
issue the Provincial Treasurer raised, the question of 
"strengthen and diversify" as opposed to "strengthen 
or diversify". I raise this question now because I get a 
feeling from what the Provincial Treasurer said here 
and in the select committee that the government is 
now leaning far more toward the strengthening of 
the economic affairs of the province than toward the 
diversification. I think it would be most regrettable if, 
in fact, it is now the government's feeling that the 
fund has now matured — to use the Provincial Treas­
urer's term — to a point where this change is needed. 

I would hope, Mr. Speaker, that the government has 
the same commitment to this question of diversification 
today as it had when the Bill was first introduced prior 
to the 1975 provincial election campaign. Very much 
of that campaign, and very much of the discussion 
around the Heritage Savings Trust Fund, wasn't only 
the strengthening of the Alberta economy, but that 
commitment to diversification was very, very impor­
tant. I would look to this occasion for a very unequi­
vocal commitment from the Provincial Treasurer that 
this change being proposed here doesn't lessen one 
iota the government's commitment to diversification, 
as diversification was outlined in the Assembly by the 
Premier on that occasion, and as it was discussed across 
— I was going to say the hills and dales of the 
province — the province in the course of that '75 elec­
tion campaign. Very much of the government's legis­
lation and commitment to Albertans at that time was to 
strengthen and diversify, not strengthen or diversify. 

It may be a subtle change to some, but I see it as 
having the potential for a very major change. That's 
why I ask the minister on the occasion of second 
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reading of this Bill about what some would see as a 
minor amendment, but what could in fact be a very 
major shift in government policy. I would hope we 
would get assurance from the minister that that isn't 
the case. 

MR. O M A N : Mr. Speaker, I welcome the proposed 
amendment. I have a couple of comments I'd like to 
make, and perhaps some questions to which the minis­
ter may want to respond. 

One of the things I've been wondering about lately 
is with regard to the public service pension fund, and 
whether the proposed amendment might be able to 
undertake something which I would like to propose. 
As I understand it now, our fund, which takes in not 
only provincial employees but many of the municipal 
and civic employees around the province and other 
jurisdictions, is an unfunded fund. In other words, the 
contributions to it simply go into the General Revenue 
Fund and the payments come out of it, if that's correct. 
At this time, I'm sure the contributions exceed the 
payments. 

But as I understand it, our senior citizen population 
right now is somewhere around 8 per cent of the total. 
We are now in the baby boom area as far as the 
working force is concerned, but I understand that 
probably in 25 years the component of senior citizens, 
or pensioners at least, would be up somewhere around 
15 per cent. I would suspect, therefore, that the pay­
ments at that point would exceed the contributions by 
quite a bit. If I understand correctly, this is one of the 
dangers to all public service pensions across Canada, 
even the Canada pension plan, whereby the contribu­
tors will have sunk to a level perilously close to being 
unable to carry it. 

I'm wondering if it wouldn't be wise for the provin­
cial government, particularly with the high profile of 
the Heritage Savings Trust Fund, to diversify perhaps 
into something like a separately funded pension fund. 
If indeed in the years to come, say by the end of the 
century, our revenues are going to be lower, so that we 
wouldn't have that much income, wouldn't it be better 
to guarantee our pension system for the future by a 
funded regime? I don't know the amount of money 
that would be involved, but certainly it would then be 
at arm's length; it would have its own investment 
policy. It seems to me, therefore, that this would be a 
legitimate use. I wonder if the Provincial Treasurer 
might see this as opening the door to such a thing. 

By the way, I was flying back from Manitoba last 
weekend and, in trying to make my time useful, I 
picked up an article from no less an authority than En 
Route, published by Air Canada. That article, called 
Future Trends and Opportunities, indicated some of 
the things that are going to be happening. I'd like to 
quote briefly. Indicating what might be happening 
in the future, it said: 

. . . if energy doesn't interest you there is no short­
age of other problems to consider. Take bureauc­
racies, for instance. More and more of our work 
force is being swallowed up by inefficient bu­
reaucracies. One of the great challenges of the 80s 
will be to try and reverse that process. "Anything 
that can increase the productivity of the service 
sector, particularly in government," says John 
Guest, "should do well. There's a strong public 
demand for less growth in the number of gov­
ernment employees without a reduction in any ex­

isting services, so some method of doing that will 
have to be found. 

Now, maybe we'll be surprised if it actually is. But if 
that takes place, I think our pension funding would be 
all the more in danger. I suggest this is a possibility 
for taking care of that concern. 

MR. SPEAKER: May the hon. minister conclude the 
debate? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

MR. H Y N D M A N : Briefly, Mr. Speaker, comments have 
been made by the Leader of the Opposition and the 
Member for Calgary North Hill With respect to those 
of the Leader of the Opposition, I think we can assure 
him that there will be no contemplation of reducing 
the commitment of the government to the concept of 
diversification, as expressed when the original Herit­
age Savings Trust Fund Act was brought before the 
Assembly and, indeed, as was expressed effectively, I 
think, by the Premier in his speech on October 10 this 
year. This amendment will enable investments to be 
made not only in the area of diversification, not only to 
continue in the area of diversification, but also in 
respect of areas, particularly in existing sectors of 
agriculture and energy, where there could be a 
strengthening without diversification. I don't think 
that will result in any measurable reduction in our 
commitment to diversification. 

I think it has to be remembered, Mr. Speaker, that it 
is essentially the private sector engine in the Alberta 
economy which has to take the initiative in respect of 
diversification. Large amounts of money can only do 
so much to generate diversification artificially, and 
that approach will not work. However, we will con­
tinue with entities such as the Alberta Opportunity 
Company, and continue the various approaches, as evi­
denced most recently, I think, by the new Ministry of 
Economic Development, which relates very much to 
economic diversification. 

On the suggestion by the Member for Calgary 
North Hill, it is true that at the moment there is not the 
traditional form of actuarial funding of the public 
service pension plans of the province. It is important 
that the integrity of those funds be carefully buttressed 
at all times and seen to be in that form of security. I 
think the suggestion by the hon. member is certainly 
worth considering. He suggests the Heritage Sav­
ings Trust Fund as a funding source; that could be 
one possible avenue. I think there could be others as 
well. It's a useful suggestion, and I will certainly bear 
it closely in mind. 

[Motion carried; Bill 77 read a second time] 

Bill 64 
The Statute Law Correction Act, 1979 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Speaker, I move second read­
ing of Bill 64, The Statute Law Correction Act, 1979. 

[Motion carried: Bill 64 read a second time] 

Bill 68 
The Highway Traffic Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. PAYNE: Mr. Speaker, as sponsor of Bill 68, The 
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Highway Traffic Amendment Act, 1979, I move second 
reading of this legislation. 

As hon. members may recall, when I introduced the 
Bill I indicated that its predecessor legislation, The 
Highway Traffic Act, 1975, no longer reflects the 
updated requirements for vehicle equipment as set out 
by the Canada motor vehicle safety standards, and 
therefore requires updating. The largest number of 
individual amendments, Mr. Speaker, are related to 
vehicle equipment safety standards. A further signifi­
cant area requiring amendment deals with vehicle 
modifications or customizing which produces vehicles 
outside standards for safe operation. Finally, changes 
are required in the Act to deal with inconsistencies in 
traffic operations legislation which have been causing 
concern to motorists and enforcement agencies alike. 
There is a fair amount of material in the legislation, 
and I thought it might be useful for me to take a 
moment or two to summarize what I regard as some of 
the more significant principles of the legislation. 

There are amendments that will specify those vehi­
cles which will require equipment — side markers, 
equipment identification, clearance and turning sign­
al lights, and operation requirements — for example, 
improved side lights for large trucks turning across 
traffic. Visibility requirements for brake and turn lamps 
have been upgraded to improve the visibility of these 
vehicles, and the establishment of warning distance for 
highway operation at highway speeds. As I've indicat­
ed earlier, these amendments simply bring the equip­
ment in line with the Canada Motor Vehicle Safety Act. 
They basically require higher intensity warning light 
systems. Mr. Speaker, the amendments specify those 
vehicles which will be required to be equipped with 
windshield wipers, defrosters, window washers, and 
such special protection as mud flaps. 

Mr. Speaker, standards have also been proposed to 
ensure that critical visibility requirements aren't im­
paired by glazing, tinting, or the application of 
murals and other means of blocking vehicle windows 
required for visibility and safe operation. The intention 
here is to ensure that the application of such decorative 
material doesn't impair driver visibility and cause un­
necessary safety hazards. 

An amendment is also proposed that would prevent 
the alteration of vehicles, and the operation of these 
vehicles on highways, where bumpers or the vehicle 
has been raised to heights which expose the fuel tanks 
and result in high-level contact with cars in parking 
areas and so on. Evidence exists that vehicles that have 
high rear ends expose their gasoline tanks to immedi­
ate contact with a vehicle at the rear. I should point out 
to you, Mr. Speaker, and to the hon. members that the 
plan for the proclamation of the amendment is that one 
year would be allowed to permit those who have modi­
fied vehicles to bring them to approved standards. 

The amendments also prevent the removal of any seat 
belt installed in the vehicle as original equipment. In 
other words, if the vehicle is sold, the second owner 
must be given the opportunity, without additional 
expense, to use the seat belts with which the vehicle was 
originally equipped. 

Two amendments deal with requiring obeyance of 
speed limits, whether established by statute, ministerial 
order, or municipal by-law. This has been extended to 
include the municipal by-law. Mr. Speaker, we are also 
proposing that the requirement for stopping when 
approaching a school bus displaying alternately flash­

ing lights be extended to roads in towns and villages 
where the speed limit exceeds 50 kilometres, or 30 
miles, per hour. 

We also propose to make it an offence to operate a 
vehicle so as to unduly disturb residents of any residen­
tial area during night hours. This refers to noise, and 
is intended to extend the terms to cover residential areas 
wherever they may exist, not just in cities. 

A new section is proposed to extend the present 
coverage to federal lands — this would include parks, 
federal Crown airports, and so on — covering the 
erection of signs and signals, the application of road 
markings, to be consistent with travel in the province 
on lands under the authority of the provincial 
government. 

A proposal has also been included to extend police 
authorization to search a motor vehicle where they have 
reasonable and probable grounds to suspect that radar 
detection devices are being employed to evade police 
activity in speed control. This amendment, Mr. Speak­
er, appears to follow the intent of the present Act, 
which provides the police authorities with the right to 
seize such devices, but has not previously given them 
the clear right to search. 

In summary, Mr. Speaker, as I've indicated earlier, 
these amendments are primarily to update and clarify 
existing sections which have been difficult to interpret: 
and enforce. As I've also indicated, it is intended that a 
period of time be allowed from proclamation to en­
forcement in those areas where equipment modifica­
tions of any significance may have to be made. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Speaker, there are some good things 
and some bad things in this Bill. With all due respect 
to the new minister and to the member presenting the 
Bill, I've never seen a Bill that tries to cover so much of 
the waterfront. 

What we're discussing here is the principle, and I 
cannot find out what principle is involved in this Bill. 
Are we looking at vehicle safety? Are we looking at 
enforcement of — how noisy your muffler is? Are we 
looking at turn signals that have to be on the right-
and left-hand sides of the front of the vehicle? Are we 
telling the federal regulating agencies how they are 
going to go about doing this? Mr. Speaker, if I've 
ever seen a Bill that requires to be taken back and 
redrafted, this is it. 

MR. PAYNE: Mr. Speaker, I'd be happy to respond to 
that rhetorical question. 

MR. SPEAKER: Perhaps after the hon. Member for 
Edmonton Norwood has had a chance to enter the 
debate. 

MRS. CHICHAK: Mr. Speaker, I'd just like to make a 
few brief remarks on this Bill. To begin with, I think 
that a lot of the principles, as I see some of them — and 
I'm not going to take away from the hon. member 
sponsoring the Bill being able to respond directly to 
the hon. Member for Clover Bar. But I think that by 
and large, many sections of this Bill deal with vehicle 
safety in its many respects: the ability to have the 
vehicle in a condition in which it would be safe to 
operate; as well, the removal of some alterations made 
to vehicles by owners which in fact do have considera­
ble impact on the safe operation of such vehicles. I'm 
pleased that a number of these items are included in 
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this legislation. 
Mr. Speaker, the point I really wanted to make with 

respect to this Bill is that although it provides different 
time frames for application and enforcement of various 
sections of the Bill coming into effect, I have a concern 
that the many areas being covered in this legislation 
are such that we can see a lot of very irate citizens if 
enforcement is applied following this legislation 
without many motorists being made well aware of the 
contents of this Bill, and that in fact we have passed it. 

So I would like to make a recommendation or a 
suggestion to the hon. minister under whose jurisdic­
tion this legislation falls that there be a very well put 
together public communication program bringing 
forward the different time frames when those aspects of 
the legislation that come into force in order that the 
motoring public is not caught unaware of what in 
fact has happened here. To simply advertise that there 
has been legislation requiring certain improvements 
or conditions of vehicles is not adequate when you 
bring so many points into effect. 

I think some of the amendments in this legislation 
will have a considerable impact with respect to insur­
ance coverage, which is rather important. 

Mr. Speaker, I just wanted to make the point that I 
hope the hon. minister will have his department put 
forward a very extensive communication and education 
program with respect to the areas raised in this Bill. 

MR. SPEAKER: May the hon. member conclude the 
debate? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

MR. PAYNE: Mr. Speaker, I welcome the opportunity 
to respond to the comments of both the Member for 
Clover Bar and the Member for Edmonton Norwood. 

The former suggested, Mr. Speaker, that we consid­
er redrafting this legislation because it deals with a 
variety of matters. May I suggest that's rather specious 
logic, in making such a recommendation. I'm very 
happy to admit that the legislation does cover a wide 
variety of subject matter, but frankly, I would simply 
regard that as a very comprehensive piece of legisla­
tion. I would hasten to remind the hon. member that 
through this comprehensive approach to this impor­
tant piece of legislation, there is one common objective 
running throughout; that is, to improve the safety 
factor in the operation of motor vehicles in this prov­
ince. Surely he must recognize that this will work to 
the benefit of all Albertans, especially those who drive 
on Alberta's roads and highways. 

As to the comments of the Member for Edmonton 
Norwood, that's a very reasonable suggestion. It's one 
that did occur to me earlier in my discussions with 
departmental officials. I did in fact elicit from them an 
indication of their public communications plans for 
some of these provisions, as the member has indicated. 

If I could give you just two or three illustrations, I 
have a tabular report indicating the timing and the 
content of these public communications programs. 
They'll deal with quite a wide variety of subjects, such 
as the updating of side marker lamps, the equipment 
update of side reflex reflectors, the hazard warning 
lamp provision, and so on. At least a half dozen of these 
are contemplated. 

If I could make just one other comment, all the 
provisions, of course, will not be simultaneously effec­

tive. There are varying time frames for compliance, 
and I think this will also address itself to the concerns 
raised by the hon. member. 

With those two responses, Mr. Speaker, I would move 
second reading of Bill 68. 

[Motion carried; Bill 68 read a second time] 

Bill 76 
The School Amendment Act, 1979 

MRS. OSTERMAN: Mr. Speaker, I move second read­
ing of Bill No. 76, The School Amendment Act, 1979. 

There are a lot of sections in this Act, and I will try 
to refer briefly to the ones that I think are of more 
significance than others. I could probably say that a 
good percentage of the amendments come about as a 
result of and as a direct response to concerns raised by 
the Alberta School Trustees' Association. 

In Section 5, briefly the amendment is there because 
there aren't always 2,000 electors in a district. So we 
now have the percentage added 25 per cent. Also in 
Section 5 dealing with meetings as a result of petition, 
the meeting will have to deal with concerns directly 
identified with the petition. 

In Section 32 (2) (e) and (f), this is just making this 
particular section consistent with The Municipal Gov­
ernment Act. 

In Section 35, a judge will now be in a position not 
to have to dismiss a trustee if the trustee has made a 
bona fide error in judgment. This section will also 
now come into line with The Municipal Government 
Act. There still can be action against a trustee whether 
or not the trustee resigns or has been defeated in an 
election. If there has been a contravention of this sec­
tion, an application against that trustee or former trus­
tee may still be made. 

In Section 49, the minister may call a by-election if in 
the opinion of the minister the official trustee has 
served his or her purpose, and the jurisdiction is now in 
a position to warrant an election, even though an 
election may not be due. There may be a by-election 
called by the minister. 

In Section 63, we now have a situation where, if 
challenged, a corporation must declare every year their 
declaration as to their funds going to the public 
school district. This will mean that the corporation 
doesn't have to make this declaration every year; their 
declaration will stand until they change it. 

Section 64, which is certainly very significant, now 
takes the undeclared corporate assessment and distri­
butes it from a resident property ratio to a resident 
pupil ratio. 

In Section 65, the early childhood services serve chil­
dren under the age of six years, of course. That is 
under The Department of Education Act. School 
boards, which now in many instances have more and 
more to do with ECS programs, will now be in a 
position as a result of this amendment to charge tui­
tion fees and transportation, putting them in the same 
position as they are with their regular services. 

Section 76 just allows a board to hire for one full, 
complete term a teacher who has been retired. 

Section 87 deals with the board of reference. The 
board of reference will now be able to make an order 
dealing with procedural or technical irregularities 
concerning any application brought before them, as 
well as with the main concerns dealt with in the 
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application. As was brought to my attention, a board 
of reference is always someone who is a judge of the 
Court of Queen's Bench. Ordinarily as a judge they 
have the ability to do that, but they sort of have to put 
on their judge's hat in order to deal with these other 
procedural or technical irregularities. They will now 
be able to do that as the board of reference. 

Section 101 just deals with short-term loans that until 
this point in time have come under the jurisdiction of 
the Local Authorities Board. This will exempt them 
from that particular area. 

Section 129 slightly improves the cash flow to mu­
nicipalities. They will be required to make their pay­
ment in August instead of May, and there will be only 
the two payments, August and November. So some 
moneys should be accruing to them as a result of 
interest on the money that they'll be holding a little 
longer. 

Section 142 certainly is one of the major amend­
ments, I would say, in that the minister will be in a 
position to make tuition agreements where a boundary 
change has been brought about as a result of provin­
cial action and an agreement hasn't been reached. 
Certainly we can elaborate on some of these things a 
little more in committee. 

Mr. Speaker, I passed over one section that I believe I 
should have referred to. When there is a strike, we are 
changing the percentage here from 60 per cent to 75 
per cent. Basically what we're talking about is that no 
school board should be in a position where they might 
be perceived to make money or in actuality make 
money as a result of a strike. I apologize for missing 
that section. 

Section 146 is just a change from calendar days to 
school days, so there won't be any argument in the case 
of a suspension. We're talking about a five-day suspen­
sion where Saturday and Sunday might be construed as 
part of that suspension; we're talking just about school 
days. 

Basically there is some improper grammar in Sec­
tion 168, and it has been corrected. 

Section 173 now deals with loitering and trespas­
sing as grounds for someone to be asked to leave a 
school. Until this time they've had to prove that 
somebody was actually disturbing in the area of the 
school. This will give school authorities far more 
leeway and authority to make sure that undesirables are 
not locating themselves in the school area. 

We intend to enact Section 17(b) but not proclaim it, 
with the hope that over the winter some of the out­
standing problems that have given rise to this section 
can be resolved at the local level. 

Thank you, Mr. Speaker. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Speaker, just two brief comments 
with regard to the Bill before us. When we get into 
committee, I'd ask if the sponsor of the Bill or the 
minister could indicate which amendments have the 
approval of the Alberta School Trustees' Association 
and the ATA? In introducing the Bill, the hon. 
member indicated that most amendments had the sup­
port of those two organizations. I think it would be 
very interesting to know which ones do and which 
ones don't. For a number of years the practice has been 
that both organizations would have an opportunity to 
express their point of view there. 

Mr. Speaker, during the course of committee I would 
also like to get some rather detailed explanation from 

the minister, specifically with regard to 142, and also 
the last section mentioned by the hon. sponsor of the 
Bill, the portion where in fact we'll pass legislation 
and then rather hold the axe. If local school boards are 
prepared to wither under the axe, the axe will not be 
dropped. I think it would indeed be interesting to 
explore those areas. If we could have those three pieces 
of information when we get into committee, it might 
enable the discussion to move along more quickly. 

MR. HIEBERT: Mr. Speaker, with reference to Bill 76 I 
would like to comment on the amendment to Section 
64. This amendment, which provides for more equita­
ble apportionment of the undeclared corporate assess­
ment, certainly has been long overdue. With approxi­
mately 25 per cent of local school board revenue being 
generated through the supplementary requisition 
based on assessment, coupled with financial constraints 
and declining enrolments, separate school boards have 
encountered definite financial hardship in providing 
equal opportunity for their youngsters. Furthermore, 
this particular amendment should assist in allaying 
the energies and dollars expended in trying to resolve 
this matter before the courts. So, based on fairness and 
equitable distribution, the split of the undeclared cor­
porate assessment on the basis of student enrolment 
rather than on the assessment base is certainly justified 
and welcomed, Mr. Speaker. 

MR. KOZIAK: Mr. Speaker, I want to make a few 
remarks as well. I was concerned that perhaps we 
would move past second reading of this Bill without 
remarks of the nature made by the Member for Edmon­
ton Gold Bar being placed on the record. This is 
extremely significant. I'd like to commend the hon. 
Member for Three Hills for bringing forward this 
legislation, which really concludes the recommenda­
tion this Assembly made a number of years ago pur­
suant to a resolution placed on the Order Paper by the 
hon. Member for Edmonton Beverly. 

Mr. Speaker, it's significant, particularly in these 
times when we are on the threshold of some substantial 
developments in this province involving capital in­
vestments of many, many billions of dollars — the 
significance that that then has, of course, on the as­
sessment available for the local jurisdiction where such 
investments are being made. For example, consider 
what happens north of Fort McMurray at the Syncrude 
site. There we have a substantial investment of capital 
by a number of companies and governments in a 
consortium. The question of distribution of assessment 
as between the two systems serving that area is 
significant. 

Now, we must realize that in certain cases a portion 
of that investment is government investment; the 
Canadian government has an investment, and the pro­
vincial government has an investment. How else can 
you determine the appropriate distribution of those 
investments for assessment than on a per-pupil basis? 
After all, the governments represent all the people in 
the province, all the people in the country. The same 
argument applies equally with Syncrude, where the 
government of the province of Alberta has a substan­
tial investment in that company through the Alberta 
Heritage Savings Trust Fund, and many, many thou­
sands of Albertans — I believe somewhere in the vicini­
ty of 60,000 — also hold shares in that company. This 
would create a great difficulty in determining the 
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apportionment of the assessment of that plant that 
should be made as between the public and separate 
school systems. 

Mr. Speaker, it's a wise move, and one that will 
definitely assist school boards in the province in fulfil­
ling their role and mandate. Again, my congratula­
tions and commendation to the hon. Member for Three 
Hills for bringing forward this very important piece 
of legislation, fulfilling a commitment to this 
Assembly. 

MR. KING: Mr. Speaker, like my colleague and my 
predecessor, I would not like the occasion of second 
reading of this Bill to pass without the opportunity to 
make a few brief remarks. While I am certainly pre­
pared to provide to the hon. Leader of the Opposition 
some of the information which he requested earlier, 
and will do that at committee stage, I think it is also 
appropriate to speak directly to some of the concerns 
which I think he was trying to raise indirectly, and 
would like to take just a moment to do that. 

I had noted, not with respect to formal submissions 
from the ASTA or the ATA but with respect to infor­
mal submissions that had come to me from local school 
boards, that the provisions dealing with petitions and 
meetings resulting from petitions are a direct response 
to a local situation and to requests which we have 
received from both school boards and electors. The 
provisions dealing with conflict of interest and disqua­
lification are in direct response to submissions we have 
received from the Alberta School Trustees' Association. 
The provisions dealing with by-elections where an of­
ficial trustee presides in the absence of a school board 
are a direct response to a particular local situation. The 
provisions that deal with undeclared corporate assess­
ment are, as my colleague has said, consistent with 
government policy. They are designed to achieve 
equity. They are consistent with government policy 
which was stated in this House as early as 1977 in 
debate on a resolution, followed by an amendment to 
the Act in 1977, and another amendment to the Act in 
1978. Certainly they are supported by at least some local 
school boards, which are going to be the beneficiaries 
of the reallocation of financial resources. 

In that regard, Mr. Speaker, it had been indicated 
upon first reading of the Bill, and I would like now to 
make clear the government's intention to provide a 
compensatory funding program to school boards 
across the province which are going to lose income as 
a result of this redistribution. The features of the plan 
are this: it will have effect for five years; it will provide 
to what we might call loser school boards 100 per cent 
compensation in the first year, 80 per cent in the 
second, 60 per cent in the third, 20 per cent in the 
fourth. The cost over the five years is estimated to be in 
the order of $10 million. The cost in the first year, for 
the province as a whole, is estimated to be $2.8 million. 
In passing, I would take issue with comments in the 
Calgary media that the loss to one school board alone 
was going to be $3 million to $4 million in a year. We 
estimate the loss across the province as a whole to be 
$2.8 million in the first year. 

The plan has been approved by the cabinet, which 
support I very much appreciate, and will come into 
effect on January 1, 1980. Department of Education 
staff have prepared financial information available to 
all the affected school boards. Meetings will be con­
ducted by staff of the department with those affected 

school boards in early December so that all of them can 
be completely aware of it in detail, aside from the 
comments I have made here this afternoon. 

At this time, Mr. Speaker, I will not continue with 
my comments about the extent to which this Bill re­
flects initiatives that have come to us from local school 
boards or local communities, except to say that by and 
large those are the genesis of the proposals contained 
in this Bill. 

Clearly, there are two exceptions. One is the amend­
ments to Section 64 of The School Act. As I have said, a 
number of school boards are in favor of the proposals. 
An even larger number believes that the proposals are 
equitable, even though they are going to lose finan­
cially in the short term. A very small number of boards, 
perhaps only one, argue that the proposal is inequit­
able. I reject that argument now, and would be pre­
pared to make clearer the grounds of my rejection at 
committee stage, if any hon. members would like to 
hear that. 

There is one other, and that is the amendment to 
Section 142. I would like to take one moment to 
explain that, if I could. It has two features. The first 
deals with boundary changes. Mr. Speaker, in most 
cases boundary changes originate locally, and are ad­
judicated by a quasi-judicial body, the Local Authori­
ties Board, which has in its authority to consider all the 
implications that result from a boundary change, and 
to attach such conditions to that boundary change as it 
believes are necessary in order to provide equity in the 
circumstances. 

Mr. Speaker, there are rare occasions when boundary 
changes result from other circumstances: when they are 
not the result of a local initiative, and when they are 
not the result of an adjudication by a quasi-judicial 
body which deals with the ramifications of the bounda­
ry change. We are discussing boundary changes be­
tween local jurisdictions which are the result of an 
action of the provincial government. In the last seven 
years there has been one of those. That was the bounda­
ry change between the county of Thorhild and the MD 
of Sturgeon. 

There is no question that as a result of that boundary 
change, which was done for good and sufficient rea­
sons in terms of municipal responsibility, there was an 
incidental fallout which had the effect of imposing 
itself on the educational attainment of a very small 
number of students. We're talking about some number 
between 20 and 60. There is no question that their 
education was affected by something done by the pro­
vincial government. There is no question that an 
opportunity existed to resolve that difficulty locally, 
and that for whatever reason the issue was not resolved 
locally. 

It is my view, Mr. Speaker, and I believe it is the view 
of my colleagues in the government, that in such cases 
where the change is the result of a provincial action, 
where the opportunity exists for local resolution, and 
where the local government does not take up the reso­
lution of the problem, a responsibility accrues to the 
province to rectify those situations, irrespective of the 
number of students involved. That is the intent of the 
first part of Section 142 of the Act. 

With respect to the second part, which deals with 
Section 150 instruction — that is to say, instruction in a 
language other than English — I would only remind 
members of the statement made by the Premier as well 
as the other first ministers in New Brunswick in 1977, 
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reaffirmed in February 1978 in Montreal, that this prov­
ince as well as others would make our best efforts, 
where numbers warrant, to provide education to the 
Francophone community in the language of their 
home and culture. This is referred to as the best efforts 
policy of this government. 

Mr. Speaker, I believe we have enjoyed considerable 
success with that policy in the last 18 months. To the 
extent we have enjoyed success, I believe it has been 
attributable to the positive co-operation of local school 
boards. Much has been done, and school boards 
throughout this province can be particularly proud of 
what has been achieved on behalf of the province. 
Nevertheless, again, a very small number of circum­
stances remain in which, although the possibility of 
local resolution exists, local resolution of the problem 
is not occurring. 

With this amendment, Mr. Speaker, we desire to 
move those situations off centre. We desire to take 
something else to the situation, as a representation of 
the dedication of provincial government to the effect of 
that policy in this province. Having done this and 
having declared our conviction in this way, we hope 
the resolution of the problems will in fact be effected 
locally and will not require the intervention of the 
province. 

Thank you, Mr. Speaker. 

[Motion carried; Bill 76 read a second time] 

MR. HORSMAN: Mr. Speaker, when the House reas­
sembles this evening at 8 p.m., I would move that it be 
in committee for further consideration of Bills, starting 
with Bill 74. 

MR. SPEAKER: Having heard the motion by the hon. 
Deputy Government House Leader, do you all agree? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

[The House recessed at 5:31 p.m. and resumed at 8 p.m.] 

head: GOVERNMENT BILLS AND ORDERS 
(Committee of the Whole) 

(continued) 

[Mr. Purdy in the Chair] 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : The Committee of the 
Whole Assembly will please come to order. 

Bill 74 
The Legislative Assembly 

Amendment Act, 1979 (No. 2) 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Are there any comments, 
questions, or amendments to be offered with respect to 
any sections of this Bill? 

There is an amendment, Mr. Minister. 

MR. C R A W F O R D : Mr. Chairman, the amendment 
which has been circulated in respect to Bill 74 simply 
accommodates the required language, in the sense 
that "salaries and expenses" is not a full description of 

what should be referred to; it should be "allowances, 
salaries, and expenses" in order to accord with other 
wording in the Act. 

[Amendment agreed to] 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Any further comments 
on the Bill itself? 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I'd like to make one or two 
points. I'd just like a point clarified on the constituency 
offices. I feel this applies to people who have to serve a 
rural constituency. The way the legislation is before 
us, I'm not exactly sure if there's any limitation as to 
how these funds can be expended. Using my constitu­
ency as an example, I feel that rather than having one 
central constituency office, it would have a lot of merit 
if I were to split that funding up into four equal 
portions, be it on staff or on space. Is there sufficient 
flexibility that that can be done, Mr. Minister? 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Chairman, my belief is that 
there is sufficient flexibility. The drafter of the Bill as 
printed and submitted follows rather closely the word­
ing used by the Miller commission, and we thought 
that was appropriate. However, at the time of drafting, 
consideration was given to the question the hon. 
member asks. My belief is that since the interpretation 
of it would clearly allow for part-time offices, the 
purpose would be so that they could be in more than 
one location, and that is with particular reference to the 
needs of a rural constituency. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, to the minister. Another 
point has always bothered me the three terms I've sat in 
this Legislature — I made representation to the former 
Premier of this province. I've always had the feeling 
that several constituencies in this province need special 
consideration. I'm just bringing this point up. In 
some of the constituencies — I'll use the one of Mr. 
Weiss, the hon. Member for Lac La Biche-McMurray. I 
think there are probably about five, maybe six, constit­
uencies in that same situation, where they have a very 
large area to serve. I think that when we make a 
recommendation to a committee, be it four years down 
the road or whenever the next independent committee 
is struck, they give some consideration to looking at 
some type of extra travelling allowance for these con­
stituencies that have large areas to serve, in that some­
times they have to charter airplanes to get to some of 
these isolated communities. 

Mr. Chairman, it has always sort of stuck in my craw 
that some of these members who have these large, 
large constituencies to serve are not being treated too 
fairly, in that they are getting the same salaries or 
indemnities as the other members, but they have much 
larger, more difficult constituencies to serve. So I 
would say to the hon. minister that I think we as a 
Legislature should look at this, address ourselves to it, 
and possibly give some direction to a committee that is 
looking at the problem next time. 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Chairman, I'm sure that's a 
fair comment. I have no prediction to make as to 
whether either the hon. member or I will be here when 
the matter comes up again, but I do think that when a 
future commission — assuming that's the course fol­
lowed — does follow it, something like that might 



1244 ALBERTA HANSARD November 13, 1979 

form part of its terms of reference. I think it deserves a 
specific look. 

The only ameliorating circumstance that has arisen 
over the years is that more transportation in the sense of 
airfare, where there's a scheduled air line, and the 
allowance in respect to gasoline available to members, 
which wasn't the case, say, a decade ago, does help to 
some extent. But I agree it's something that should be 
looked at more specifically. 

MR. NOTLEY: There are a couple of questions I'd like 
to put to the minister sponsoring the Bill, if I may. 
First, Mr. Minister and Mr. Chairman, what discussions 
have taken place with respect to the use of provincial 
buildings? I know that the Members' Services Commit­
tee was looking at this, but the entire question was 
really deferred until Bill 74 was introduced in the 
Legislature. It would seem to me that where space is 
available in provincial buildings, that is the obvious 
place the MLA's office should be located. When people 
go in to do business with the various government 
departments, it strikes me that having the one-roof 
facility should also, where practical, include the MLA's 
office. 

The second point: I realize some provision is made in 
staffing the office and setting it up. I would ask the 
minister sponsoring the Bill whether any specific con­
sideration has been given to making available, at least 
for each constituency office, the statutes of the province 
as well as the Bills that have been passed in the last 10 
years. I say that because wherever you go, especially in 
rural areas, you run into people who just can't get easy 
access to the statutes. I have kept a set in my home, and 
would want to do so, because I get people calling me 
at home. But if you're going to have constituency 
offices that will be useful, especially in the rural areas, 
they should be equipped with a set of the statutes of the 
province. 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Chairman, my first reaction is 
that it wouldn't be a formidable expense to consider 
providing copies of the statutes to constituency offices. 
Since the question of constituency offices is newly aris­
en, matters like that will come up and should be 
considered in conjunction with it. With respect to that 
point specifically, though, and in respect of the first 
one with regard to the use of provincial buildings, my 
feeling would be that no firm policies should be ar­
rived at without the intervention of the Members' Serv­
ices Committee. 

As to the use of provincial buildings, I would not 
want to commit my colleagues to a view on the sub­
ject, but one or two observations might be made. One 
is that the existence of the allowance for constituency 
offices may make the alternative suggested by the hon. 
member less pressing than might have appeared to be 
the case before. The other is that the question of the 
Legislature and the duties of the member in respect to 
the Legislature are presumed, I think, to be independ­
ent of any involvement as a member of the government 
or otherwise; he has duties that relate specifically to the 
constituency as a representative. I don't say that because 
of that it's less appropriate to consider the suggestion 
with regard to provincial buildings, but it is a factor 
and is something I would think the Members' Services 
Committee could be most helpful on. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. C R A W F O R D : Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill 74 
be reported as amended. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 44 
The Firefighters and Policemen 

Labour Relations Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : There is an amendment. 
Are there comments or questions to be offered with 
respect to any section of this Act? 

MR. NOTLEY: Mr. Chairman, to begin where we left 
off before, I have a couple of questions in my mind, 
and they really flow from the meetings that took place 
prior to the introduction of this Act. Perhaps I could 
outline my understanding of the meetings, and then 
we could ask for a response from the minister. 

It is my understanding, Mr. Chairman, that the 
minister phoned the president of Local 209 several days 
before the session opened, and asked to have a meeting. 
Subsequently, the president of Local 209 suggested to 
the minister that perhaps it would be better that the 
meeting be held with the Alberta Fire Fighters Asso­
ciation, if there was in fact going to be a review of the 
Act. 

Mr. Chairman and Mr. Minister, it's my further 
understanding that on October 10, the day the Legis­
lature reopened, Mr. d'Esterre phoned the vice-
president of the Alberta Fire Fighters Association at 3 
o'clock in the afternoon, about one-half hour after the 
Legislature had reopened, and suggested that a meet­
ing take place, and that the following day, the same 
Mr. d'Esterre phoned the president of Local 209 to 
request a meeting with the minister. That was the 
meeting the minister referred to last week. 

The reason I raise that, Mr. Chairman — it's my 
understanding that that meeting took place on Octo­
ber 11, between 4:30 p.m. and 7 p.m. — is that as I look 
at the Order Paper, the Bill was already on notice. If the 
Bill was on notice before the meeting with the fire­
fighters took place, how can we suggest there was any 
kind of consultation? Not to have consultation with the 
firefighters before the legislation was drafted, in my 
view, can only lead to problems down the road. It's an 
invitation to trouble. 

Before going any further, Mr. Chairman, I would 
invite the minister to either confirm these dates or 
advise us what his memory is of the chain of events 
leading to the meeting he referred to last week. 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, I don't have my diary 
with me. Had I realized that that might be useful to 
the consideration of this Bill, I could have brought it 
down. But I wasn't aware that that would be an essen­
tial ingredient of the discussion of the substance of the 
Bill this evening. 

I can only report what I reported before, Mr. Chair­
man; that is, that the court decision came down, I 
believe, in March 1979. Up to the point at which a 
court action was initiated as to the interpretation of the 
legislation, there had not been a problem with the 
legislation, in terms of the ability of fire departments 
in all areas except Edmonton to use, to interpret, and to 
mutually agree to and evolve what were very good and 
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apparently deemed to be very practical working rela­
tionships as to the administration and organization of 
the department. 

In short, Mr. Chairman, in the case of Calgary — 
not unlike Edmonton — where there are over 800 fire­
fighters, it was deemed reasonable on the part of the 
firefighters' local and on the part of the city adminis­
tration to have three deputy chiefs. That was the 
agreement they arrived at in consultation one with the 
other. They further arrived at an arrangement whereby 
they were satisfied as to the promotional requirements 
and procedures for individuals who would be eligible 
potentially to become deputy fire chief. 

That, then, was the arrangement we had until a 
dispute between the city of Edmonton and Local 209 
caused the matter to go to court. It should be known 
here that while this seems to be an issue in principle, it 
was not such an issue in principle that even in 
Edmonton prior to the court date there had been an 
acceptance of two deputy fire chiefs, which is one more 
than the legislation provided for, according to the 
local. It would appear even the local saw the reality of 
the situation and was willing to acknowledge there 
should more than one deputy chief. 

I can't be certain, but it was my understanding that 
the real problems arose when the city apparently tried 
to appoint in a manner and through a procedure 
which was unacceptable to the local. So the local chal­
lenged the law as it then stood and obtained an inter­
pretation contrary to that which was had been in 
vogue and used by the various fire departments up to 
that point in time. That produced a situation in which 
the arrangements that had been worked out with both 
police and firefighters in other cities, and at least in 
the case of the police force in the city of Edmonton, 
were no longer legal if challenged. 

I have to say, Mr. Chairman, that when the matter 
was first brought to my attention I couldn't believe we 
had a problem of this nature, and it was some time 
before my officials were able to gain the appropriate 
amount of my attention. But when I realized the gravi­
ty of the situation from the various legal opinions I 
was receiving, I then agreed that we would consider 
an amendment. 

Mr. Chairman, what I think is important is to realize 
that the situation which Local 209 in particular now 
does not like was the situation which Local 209 in 
particular precipitated. 

Moving then to the consultation, which the hon. 
Member for Spirit River-Fairview wishes to indulge in, 
I would only say that it had been my understanding 
that there was some consultation earlier on. I believe 
that to be the case. It is clear that it was not what both I 
and the firefighters would have wished it to have been. 
Lest there be some confusion, however, I want to reiter­
ate that I had but one meeting of the municipalities, of 
any municipalities, before the legislation was intro­
duced, and one meeting with firefighters. Prior to the 
attempt which the hon. member mentions, there was an 
unsuccessful effort to reach the president of the Alberta 
Fire Fighters Association. It was unfortunate that he 
was out of town. It's no fault on his part, and it took us 
a while to realize what was happening. 

I believe there was some other consultation. I'm 
afraid it was unofficial consultation. So I am at that 
point where, without going to get my diary, I can't 
verify for the hon. member other than to say I had two 
meetings. If the date is right — which I'm not certain 

about, within a couple of days — the hon. member's 
information with respect to the hours of the meeting is 
right. It was a very long meeting. It went from about 
4 or 4:30 p.m. through to 7:30 p.m. at least, a very full 
meeting. We examined the issue in depth vertically 
and in extreme horizontally, and I think we examined 
it from any other angle it could be examined from. Mr. 
Chairman, I believe that will respond to the hon. 
member. 

MR. NOTLEY: Mr. Chairman, if I can follow along 
for a moment. With great respect, Mr. Minister, in my 
judgment anyway, that really doesn't absolve the gov­
ernment from the charge that there really wasn't ade­
quate consultation. Because we're dealing with people 
who are protecting life and limb, people who are the 
heroes today in the Toronto area as a result of a very 
dangerous fire on a tanker derailment. In my view, 
we're dealing with people where, as a government, if 
you're not going to say to these people, you have the 
ultimate or else, then we do have to say we will go the 
extra mile and then the extra mile beyond that to make 
sure there is consultation. 

What you're telling us, Mr. Minister, is that there 
really wasn't consultation. At best, there was some kind 
of informal liaison, you say "before". But when it 
comes to actual consultation, where the minister sits 
down with representatives of the firefighters and says, 
we are going to open up the Act, and this is what we 
are going to do: as I understand it, that did not occur 
until the eleventh, when Bill 44 was already on the 
Order Paper. Now unless this government has a new 
approach to drafting legislation — that is, they put 
the Bill on the Order Paper before they've got the 
legislation drafted — I can only conclude that the 
legislation in fact was ready to go before the meeting 
took place. I say to you, Mr. Minister, that it is simply 
not good enough for the Minister of Labour or any 
other member of the cabinet to claim you have consul­
tation when we have a fait accompli. 

Now I want to deal with this business of the Act and 
the history for a moment. As I understand the history 
very briefly, prior to 1969 it was called The Fire 
Departments Platoon Act. At that time, only the chief 
was outside the bargaining unit. In 1969 the munici­
palities wanted the Act opened up to remove everyone 
above district chief. At that particular time in the city of 
Edmonton, it was in the neighborhood of 15 people; it 
would now be in the neighborhood of 25 people. In 
1969 the union's position was, no, we want to maintain 
the status quo. The saw-off, as a result of the delay in 
the legislation that was made reference to in Mr. 
Pugh's remark — which I don't need to read into the 
record again, because I think it was read last time by 
both Dr. Buck and me — was the chief and the deputy, 
but never any more than one deputy. 

Now what happened subsequently? We had nego­
tiated arrangements, but in the case of Edmonton they 
applied to add one more deputy chief. It's important to 
recall, Mr. Minister, that that particular decision, while 
it had the acquiescence of the union, didn't have the 
support. As I recollect, the city promised in 1971 that 
there would be no more than two deputy chiefs. The 
union said: we'll acquiesce to that; we won't challenge 
it. Then the city began to use junior captains in the 
two deputy chief positions. A junior lieutenant and a 
firefighter of 14 years' experience was being groomed 
for the position of deputy chief to protect promotional 
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policy. 
It was at this juncture that Local 209 decided they 

would seek clarification of the Act. Now, Mr. Minister, 
you've been saying they have challenged the Act. It 
was at this juncture that they sought clarification of 
the Act. Their position was upheld. It was taken to 
appeal court. And as I understand the court of appeal, 
the majority decision accepted the interpretation of the 
Act that Local 209 had argued for all along. 

A number of questions were asked. To properly de­
bate this subject, Mr. Chairman, question number one: 

. . . whether, pursuant to Section 2(c) of The Fire­
fighters and Policemen Labour Relations Act as 
amended, the city of Edmonton is empowered to 
designate more than one individual as deputy 
chief. Thereby excluding the said individual or 
individuals from the bargaining unit represented 
by the International Association of Firefighters 
Local 209. 

That was the first question asked. The majority deci­
sion on that question was no. 

The second question: 
. . . whether pursuant to Section 3 of The Fire­
fighters and Policemen Labour Relations Act as 
amended, the city of Edmonton is empowered to 
deny more than two individuals the rights therein 
enumerated, by designating the said individuals 
chief or deputy chief. 

Again, Mr. Minister, the court said no. 
Now there was a dissenting judgment. But the dis­

senting judgment, as I see it, really doesn't confirm 
the position you've indicated in this House. On page 2 
of the dissenting judgment: 

The issue here however, is not this city's right to 
appoint such officials, but as to whether the addi­
tional deputy chief 

in this case the deputy chief of operations 
and the newly advertised positions are to be classi­
fied as members of the respondents' union or not, 
having regard for the provision of the Act. 

So what occurred, Mr. Minister, was not a happy situa­
tion where everybody was satisfied until nasty old Local 
209 took the thing to court. We had a clarification. 
And the clarification, Mr. Minister, was that the un­
ion's position was correct. 

Having said that, it seems to me that in a sense we've 
been told in this House that there would have been no 
problem if there hadn't been a challenge. What do you 
expect? There was a disagreement, a very serious dis­
agreement. The obvious and responsible thing for 
Local 209 to do would be to seek legal clarification. 
That legal clarification was sought, and the majority 
decision was in favor of the union's position. That 
being the case, it seems to me that after the union has 
taken the initiative and obtained the clarification, we 
are saying: whoops, what the courts have found is the 
case all along; we really don't mean it that way, so 
without proper consultation, calling in the key people 
the day after the Legislature reconvenes, we will 
change the Act to make what was a practice in other 
areas legal if it was challenged. But as I understand it, 
it would take a challenge to put the thing into any 
degree of prejudice at all. And if there's no disagree­
ment in the other departments, then the likelihood of a 
challenge isn't there. 

I come to the bottom line. Mr. Chairman and Mr. 
Minister. The court case was in March. We've now 
gone through seven and a half months. I just fail to 

see why it is so impossible to wait an extra three and a 
half months. Bring the legislation back in the spring 
session so we can properly debate it and the consulta­
tion can take place, so the firefighters feel that not only 
has justice been done, but it is seen to have been done. 

MR. COOK: Mr. Chairman, I was going to ask a 
couple of questions just for information. Last day I 
made some remarks. I was a little confused on some of 
the negotiation process, and I'm still fuzzy. [interjec­
tion] Just for the record and for the House, could the 
minister outline the events that led to the appeal court 
decision? I wonder specifically about the initiative of 
Local 209 in challenging this and, secondly, the initi­
ative of the city administration in taking it to the 
appeal court or to the court process. 

Secondly, Mr. Minister, I wonder if I could ask who 
initiated the request for the legislation. Was it the city? 
Or did it come from within the Department of Labour, 
staff members who were handling this case? 

Finally, could the minister advise the House whether 
there's been consultation with other city administra­
tions that would be affected; for example, Calgary, 
Lethbridge, or Sherwood Park? 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, the hon. Member for 
Edmonton Glengarry is not carrying his two-by-four 
tonight, so I guess I can get up and make a few 
comments. 

Mr. Chairman and members of the committee, I will 
not go through the information laid before us by the 
hon. Member for Spirit River-Fairview. But I would 
just like to remind the hon. minister that we are serv­
ants of the people; we are here to serve the people. In 
serving the voter and the people of this province in 
their best interests, I think the hon. minister has not 
indicated to us why this legislation cannot wait for 
three and a half months. Before I will vote positively 
for a Bill, the hon. minister is going to have to 
convince me why this cannot be held until we have full 
and open consultation. The minister has not been able 
to convince me that we have had that kind of full and 
open consultation. 

Mr. Chairman, the hon. minister seems to be trying 
to get the point across to some government back­
benchers that this was a problem created just by Local 
209. If the hon. members of the government back­
benches will look at the information that has been 
handed to them, the other unions in this province 
unanimously asked that this legislation be held. It's 
not just the one union; all the unions are asking the 
hon. minister to hold this. 

Mr. Chairman, I have other questions and concerns 
that I will be bringing up later. But I do wish to 
remind this Legislature that Bills like this would never 
appear on the Order Paper if this House were evenly 
divided. 

AN HON. MEMBER: Hear, hear. 

AN HON. MEMBER: Oh, Walt. 

DR. BUCK: It's fine for you to be able to say that. But 
this type of controversial legislation would not be 
brought in. The minister would have to convince this 
Assembly and the people involved in the dispute that 
the legislation is needed right now. He has not been 
able to do that. Surely the hon. members in the back 
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benches cannot be telling their minister to hold it, 
because if they are getting the same representation as 
we are getting, they would hold this legislation. 

MR. NOTLEY: Exactly. 

DR. BUCK: Because the representation being made to 
the government backbenchers is exactly the representa­
tion being made to us in the opposition. 

MR. NOTLEY: It's unanimous. 

DR. BUCK: So I cannot understand how the members 
in the back benches can sit there in all conscience — in 
all conscience, I say, Mr. Chairman — and support the 
legislation before us. Who are they serving? Are they 
serving their people, or are they serving their party? 

So I would like to say, Mr. Chairman, that we are 
asking the minister to hold the legislation until the 
spring session. If we are here to serve the people, surely 
that legislation should be held. 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, first of all I think we've 
been over quite a bit of this subject on more than one 
occasion. However, perhaps I should refresh the me­
mories of hon. members with respect to the question 
that I believe the hon. Member for Edmonton Glengar­
ry asked: how did this develop? My understanding is 
that for some number of years, the best part of a decade, 
some increasing dissatisfaction has been brewing in 
the Edmonton situation between the firefighters' 
union Local 209 and the city administration. That dis­
satisfaction has been exercised by a challenge to legis­
lation at a given point in time. 

Now, whether the challenge would be the cure for 
the problem — it doesn't appear to have been because, 
as I am given to understand by both parties, the 
problem has gotten progressively worse since the 
court decision came down. So nothing really happened 
with respect to the Edmonton problem as a conse­
quence of the court decision. And let's keep that in 
perspective, because I think it's very important. 

The hon. Member for Spirit River-Fairview talks 
about safety of the public and the importance of fire­
fighters. I agree with and feel very keenly about all 
these things, the same as I agree that policemen are 
often heroes and have a dangerous job to do. I have 
already pointed out that in connection with this legis­
lation, policemen were affected by the court decision. 
Do we find any policemen complaining? No we don't; 
we don't find one. I ask members to reflect on that 
matter. 

Mr. Chairman, I think we have a very unfortunate 
situation in Edmonton. It is a situation of inability of 
Local 209 and the city administration to agree on a 
series of problems they mutually have acquired. I am as 
dedicated and as interested as any member in this 
House. Furthermore I have the ultimate responsibility 
to make sure that the public interest is assured with 
respect to firefighting and labor relations, and it is my 
intention to do just that. 

Accordingly, despite the efforts of some hon. mem­
bers to confuse the issue, I have done my level best to 
distinguish between a local Edmonton problem and a 
problem which is province-wide. The problem which is 
province-wide arises because, as a consequence of the 
court decision, we need to make legally right and 
permissible what the parties by mutual agreement had 

worked out over a decade. Despite all the history, hon. 
Member for Spirit River-Fairview, they worked it out 
over a decade. They evolved a system of mutual agree­
ment. Regardless of what the judges said the legisla­
tion meant, the parties mutually agreed that it meant 
something else, and they proceeded to act realistically. 
Looking at their situation, they agreed that a fire-
fighting force of 800-plus men and, in some cases, 
much smaller forces, should have more than one deputy 
chief. They mutually agreed on that. 

In Calgary they went even further, and I give them 
full credit for doing so. They worked out a system by 
which they had mutual agreement on the determina­
tion of how many deputy chiefs there would be. Then 
they had mutual agreement on a second point: what 
basic qualifications a candidate for deputy chief would 
have to have. Further, they did a third thing: they 
mutually agreed on the appropriate kind of training 
program. 

They did those three things by mutual agreement, 
acting in concert, with the public interest in mind, and 
with the idea of making their work place, the fire 
department, the best, most desirable place to work in 
that they could achieve. They succeeded in all that. 

In Edmonton we have a dispute. They challenge the 
legislation and get a court decision that what was 
worked out in Calgary isn't permissible under the law 
as we have it. 

Now I ask all hon. members: what kind of sense does 
it make, that we should allow an interpretation of 
legislation to reverse very healthy, positive, mutual 
relations in labor relations and conduct of our fire-
fighting forces, if we're talking about the public in­
terest? I ask you all to think on that. 

So that is the reason for the legislation. It is a legal 
reason, pure and simple. We're talking about one "s" 
in dispute. One "s". 

Mr. Chairman, I have tried to approach the Edmon­
ton problem in a different way. I have secured the 
agreement of the president of Local 209, the mayor of 
the city of Edmonton, the chief commissioner, and 
some of the other commissioners now, to provide to 
them our senior labor management advisory people to 
try to assist in a consultation process which would, 
among other things, get agreement on a proper 
training program. I have heard from both parties that 
that's their objective. They are unable to do it. Surely, 
with the common interest they have, it can be achieved, 
and I fully believe it can. But it has to be treated as 
something separate and apart from the problem we 
have before us. Hon. members, I trust all will address 
that, and that we keep it separate and apart from this 
matter before us. 

I have spent over 10 hours in consultation with either 
the provincial firefighters or with the Local 209 fire­
fighters. It is not an easy problem to solve. If it had 
been easy, I would have the answer. Mr. Chairman, I 
have agreed, and I have made a commitment in writ­
ing to the president of the Alberta Fire Fighters Asso­
ciation, that I would have a meeting at the most 
convenient time — I believe we have an agreement 
now — in the month of January. We would not pro­
claim this part — the one "s" — before the month of 
January, at least before that time, and at least before we 
have that meeting, unless it is challenged in court. We 
would proclaim the portion dealing with policemen 
immediately, because there is no question, no dispute at 
all with respect to policemen. 
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So, Mr. Chairman, I think I have gone a long way 
to listening to all parties. I have to confess I've listened 
but once to the municipalities, because the legal advice 
I have received suggests that we have a problem on 
which, unless we want to undo the good work which 
has been achieved by mutual effort to this time, we had 
better act. 

Mr. Chairman, I repeat again that I have had three 
meetings with the Alberta Fire Fighters Association. 
We have explored a series of concerns, not all of them 
related to legislation by any means. I have tried to put 
in place some assistance to aid Local 209 and the city to 
overcome some very long standing difficulties which 
they have. I am convinced that that is the appropriate 
solution for that particular problem. I really don't 
know what more I can do at this stage to overcome a 
problem of the nature which the hon. member sug­
gests there is. 

MR. NOTLEY: First, Mr. Chairman, the minister's 
statements would carry a good deal more force if we 
had a situation where the only local concerned about it 
and protesting the legislation was Local 209. But that 
is not the case. We have unanimity among every local 
of firemen in the province of Alberta saying, hold the 
act. [applause] 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Order in the gallery, 
please. 

MR. NOTLEY: Not even one of the locals is saying, we 
think the minister is reasonable and we'd like this clari­
fied. Without exception all the locals are saying, hold 
the legislation. 

Then we get the second point. The minister has now 
said, we're not going to proclaim the legislation until 
after a meeting in January. This appeal judgment was 
on March 9, a little more than eight months ago. For 
eight months it was apparently not so vital that we 
move on it. If it had been so critical, Mr. Chairman, we 
would have dealt with it in the spring session of the 
Legislature. If it was that critical I can't imagine that 
this government would have been so cavalier as to say, 
well, we'll just let it slide to the fall. 

So we let it wait for eight months, and now we're 
going to let it wait for another two months. It's 
almost certain that the spring session of the Legisla­
ture will start in late February or early March, unless 
we aren't going to have legislatures any more, or 
whatever the case may be. So we're looking at a spring 
session of the Legislature in early March, seven or 
eight weeks more. I say to the minister, why in hea­
ven's name are we getting into this corner? You have 
the unanimous position of the Alberta Fire Fighters 
saying, hold the legislation over. If you want to deal 
with a separate Act as far as the policemen are con­
cerned, and proclaim it, fine, we can do that. That will 
not be the most difficult thing in the world. 

It seems to me that we're getting ourselves in this 
corner for seven or eight weeks of having the legisla­
tion in force. For the life of me, Mr. Chairman, I can't 
follow the logic of that. Why is it that we have to do it? 
The minister says, we've got to overcome any ambi­
guity in the law: it could be challenged. Of course it 
could be challenged. But it's not going to be chal­
lenged in the other places, because they've developed 
satisfactory situations. It's obviously not going to be 
challenged by the unions, because all the locals in the 

province are saying, hold it over. So they're not going 
run out tomorrow and challenge it. Obviously it's 
going to be satisfactory to the municipalities. So what 
is this great fear? 

Moreover, Mr. Chairman, if we really wanted to look 
at legislation that could be challenged, we just talked 
about whether a Bill, I think it's Bill 59, that the 
Minister of Energy and Natural Resources is going to 
be dealing with a little later is constitutional. We'll 
have to wait and see. It could be challenged too. But 
we're almost certainly going to pass it, notwithstand­
ing that, despite the fact that it could be challenged. 
Mr. Chairman, why do it when you have unanimous 
opposition? 

The minister says, we have to develop a better attitu-
dinal position. Sure we do. But a better attitudinal 
position is surely going to be based on sitting down 
and talking with people before the legislation is 
drafted, Mr. Minister, not the very day it appears on the 
Order Paper. With great respect to you, what a cavalier 
way to treat firefighters in this province. 

Surely if this is such an urgent matter now, the 
legal advice the minister got would have convinced 
him that he had to move much earlier. Yet we don't 
have this movement until the Legislature is in session. 
Then all of a sudden we're committing to: damn the 
torpedoes, we're moving ahead. I say to you, Mr. 
Minister, with greatest respect, that is not the way to 
develop a workable, positive labor relations environ­
ment between municipalities and firefighters in this 
province. 

I conclude by saying that the arguments presented 
by the minister have failed to deal with the central 
points: lack of consultation, and why it is necessary to 
pass this legislation when, at most, we're going to be 
dealing with a period of seven or eight weeks when it 
would be proclaimed. 

MR. R. SPEAKER: Mr. Chairman, I say this to the 
minister: I've tried very hard to understand exactly the 
reasons we can't hold this legislation and bring it 
back in the spring session. The conclusion I come to at 
this point in time, after listening to the minister ex­
plain his position, is that the government and the 
minister and his officials do not trust some of the local 
firefighter organizations in the province of Alberta. 
That's the conclusion I come to at the present time. Mr. 
Chairman, I think that's a very unfortunate situation, 
because in order for harmony to exist and for all parties 
to agree on something even in January, we have to 
have trust at this point in time. 

The only reason I can see that the minister is so 
adamant in passing the amendment at this point in 
time is that he feels that between now and January, one 
of the locals will challenge the existing legislation, 
and if he doesn't have in hand the requested amend­
ment, he can't say to them: if you challenge us, I 
bring in the amendment, and that's the end of you. He 
has that threat at hand at all times. Now, Mr. Chair­
man, I think what we're saying is that if we start from 
that assumption at this point in time, in January the 
people requesting changes and concerned about the 
legislation at this time haven't one hope at all of 
getting the changes they desire. The amendment 
we're going to pass during this Legislature, that the 
minister's requesting us to support, will be the same 
legislation and the same ideas that will be supported 
by the minister in January and will not change. So 
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what will be the discussions at that point in time? I 
don't think they will amount to very much. 

So the reason I think the minister and the govern­
ment want the legislation at this time is that they don't 
trust the locals. Even the Calgary one, that seems to be 
agreeable with the position of the minister, may want 
to do something. Some other locals may challenge it. 
The trust isn't there, so we need this legislated weapon 
to use between now and January. Mr. Chairman, I 
don't think that's a good enough reason for us to 
support it and pass it in this Assembly. 

In my own interpretation, there's no way I can 
support it, and certainly I think other members of the 
Legislature who have firefighter organizations in 
their constituencies should assess what they are doing 
as responsible legislators at this point in time. If it's 
legislation to be used as threats, that's one thing; if it's 
legislation to solve a problem and bring harmony in 
an organization, that's another. But I don't think we 
are really doing the latter at the present time. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I'm sure the hon. minister 
is conversant with most of the facts. But when the 
minister compares the Calgary and the Edmonton si­
tuations, I think it's only right that the hon. govern­
ment backbenchers should be aware that in the Cal­
gary situation officers of captain's rank of at least five 
years' seniority are the only ones who can write for 
deputy chief, whereas the chief in Edmonton has al­
lowed members with only one year's service to write for 
deputy chief. Also I think the government backbench­
ers should be aware that the fire department has 
brought in outsiders for jobs that in the ordinary 
sequence of events really belong to Local 209; that is, 
the chief of communications and the chief of services. 
I'd like the members, the government backbenchers, to 
be aware that the local is grievancing the mechanic's 
position. But if the local should win, placing an "s" 
behind "deputy chief" and making it "chiefs" could 
annul that situation. 

I believe the minister should take some things back 
to his caucus. It's quite obvious the government back­
benchers are going to listen to what the minister and 
the government tell them. So if the minister will not 
consider holding the legislation until the spring, I 
think it's only fair to his own backbenchers that he at 
least take it back to caucus and explain it to the 
backbenchers so they understand, and not have them 
just listen to what the government whip tells them 
they should do. If they are responsible members of this 
Legislature, they will ascertain the facts. 

MR. WEISS: Mr. Chairman, I object to the innuendoes 
and accusations that I am sitting as a member of this 
back bench not fully conversant and intelligent 
enough to know what I understand and what I don't 
understand. I fully believe that I act according to the 
way I feel and believe is right, and neither the minister 
nor the whip is telling me how I vote, how I act, or 
how I listen. I would like the hon. member please to 
refrain from using the words he has. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I would ask the hon. 
member, if he is conversant with the facts as they apply 
to Calgary and Edmonton, to recite those facts to the 
members of this Assembly. I challenge that hon. 
member that he is not conversant with the facts. He, or 
members of the back benches, have not indicated why 

this legislation should be brought in, and I don't 
think the minister has convinced his backbenchers of 
why there is such expediency and immediacy for this 
legislation. So I would like to say that if the govern­
ment is afraid of losing face by backing down and 
saying we'll bring it in in the spring, at least take it 
back to the caucus and bring it back tomorrow, Mr. 
Chairman. 

MR. NOTLEY: First, Mr. Minister, I understand that 
legal opinions on the arrangements elsewhere, in par­
ticular in the city of Calgary, are that where you have 
an agreement there's nothing illegal about that. The 
government's whole case for moving ahead is that if 
we don't ram this legislation through, somehow the 
situation elsewhere in the province is going to 
change overnight. Mr. Minister, you have agree­
ments. Those agreements aren't going to be broken 
in the next three and a half months. My understanding 
is that that is the legal opinion of more than one 
lawyer. So why the rush? That really has to be ex­
plained to us before we can pass this legislation. 

I go back to the arguments raised before. What is at 
stake here in Edmonton is something that has develop­
ed over a period of time. There's no question about 
that. It's in part an attitudinal situation. But when the 
minister rose, as he did on the 7th, I felt — and perhaps 
the way you put it was not the way you felt the situa­
tion was. But the way you put it, you seemed to place 
most of the responsibility for that situation on Local 
209. 

I don't see how anyone looking at the situation in 
Edmonton in the last eight or nine years could place 
all the responsibility for that situation on Local 209. As 
matter of fact, I think Local 209 has been more than 
willing to try to work with the legislation agreed to 
in 1969. And remember it was a saw-off in 1969. In 
1971, when the city wanted to add a deputy chief, the 
union wrote and said, no, that's not the way we inter­
pret the law. But because the city came back and said, 
just a minute, we want no more than two, there was 
acquiescence. But then we got a little niggling 
around the edges and this whole business of leap­
frogging over people who have been in the service. 
How can you possibly have effective service in any kind 
of public occupational field if you disrupt the promo­
tional system? The city was just asking for trouble. 

Instead of ranting and raving, the union went to 
court and said, give us an interpretation of the law. 
They got an interpretation. The city didn't like it, and 
they appealed it. And the appeal court, two to one, 
supported the position of Local 209. The suggestion 
that somehow everything would have been hunky-dory 
if it hadn't been for this test . . . It wouldn't have been 
hunky-dory at all, because the city would simply have 
been successful in niggling away at the edges of the 
legislation. And what had been achieved honorably in 
other places as a result of mutual negotiation would 
have resulted in a de facto situation in the city of 
Edmonton where people were removed from the bar­
gaining unit. 

How can you expect Local 209 to act in any other 
way? It's this sort of bottom-line position, Mr. Minister, 
that has created a feeling of unanimity among fire­
fighters in this province, some of whom have a dif­
ferent relationship with their respective departments 
than Local [209] does with the city of Edmonton. 

You know, when I see some of the resolutions here 
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for example, the resolution to the Alberta Provincial 
Fire Chiefs Association convention on June 11 to 14, 
1972 — I just have to say that this is the kind of 
provocation which I think we have to read into the 
record too, since we've talked about Local 209 asking 
for a clarification. Let me read this: 

WHEREAS the Firefighters and Policemen La­
bour Relations Act . . . provides that the 
"bargaining unit" means the Firefighters and the 
Fire Department of a Municipality, excluding the 
Chief and the Deputy Chief, and 

WHEREAS this same Act provides for Police­
men of a Municipal Police Force who hold the 
rank of Inspector or higher to be in one bargain­
ing unit and Policemen who hold ranks lower 
than that of Inspector to be in a separate bargain­
ing unit, 

THEREFORE BE IT RESOLVED, that this 
Association request the Minister of Labour to 
amend the aforementioned Act to provide separate 
bargaining units for those members of a Munici­
pal Fire Department who hold the rank of Captain 
or higher, excluding the Fire Chief and Deputy 
Fire Chiefs and those members who hold ranks 
lower than that of a Captain. 

Mr. Chairman, a statement like that presented to the 
fire chiefs' convention is so totally at odds with the 
trade-off in 1969 that it can do nothing other than lead 
to problems, to bad feelings, and eventually to the 
clarification that was sought in the courts. 

Mr. Chairman, I would just suggest to the members 
that in my view we have not heard a reasonable ex­
planation of why this Assembly should pass the legis­
lation. Therefore I would like to move the following 
amendment: that Bill 44, The Firefighters and Police­
men Labour Relations Amendment Act, 1979, not be 
reported during this session. 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : We have an amendment 
in front of the House that we have to deal with first. 
Then we'll come back to this amendment. 

Are you ready for the question on the government 
amendment dated October 24? The amendment to the 
Bill is: 

That Section 4 is struck out and the following is 
substituted: 
4 (1) This Act, except Section 3, comes into force 

the day on which it is assented to. 
(2) Section 3 comes into force on the day to be 

fixed by proclamation. 

[Motion on amendment carried] 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : We have an amendment 
from the Member for Spirit. River-Fairview. I'll just 
wait until all members have a copy of that amendment. 

MR. NOTLEY: Mr. Chairman, just so we can proceed 
with the amendment. It's very simple; it's a hoist. It's 
that The Firefighters and Policemen Labour Relations 
Amendment Act not be reported during this session. 
It's a simple hoist. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I'd like to speak on the 
amendment. I think that we will now see if govern­
ment backbenchers really will speak as the hon. Mem­
ber for Lac La Biche-McMurray has indicated [interjec­
tions] that they are free to vote as they please in this 

Legislature, and that they are free to vote as they feel 
the facts are. Mr. Chairman, we'll see how free they are 
to vote. 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Are you ready for the 
question on the amendment proposed by the Member 
for Spirit River-Fairview? 

[Mr. Deputy Chairman declared the motion on the 
amendment lost. Several members rose calling for a 
division. The division bell was rung] 

[Three minutes having elapsed, the House divided] 

For the motion: 
Buck Notley Speaker. R. 
Clark, R. 

Against the motion: 
Adair Fyfe Osterman 
Anderson, C. Gogo Pahl 
Anderson, D. Harle Paproski 
Batiuk Hiebert Pengelly 
Bogle Horsman Planche 
Borstad Hyndman Reid 
Bradley Isley Russell 
Campbell Johnston Schmidt 
Carter King Shaben 
Chambers Koziak Stevens 
Chichak Kroeger Stewart 
Clark. L. Kushner Stromberg 
Cook Leitch Thompson 
Cookson Lysons Topolnisky 
Crawford Magee Trynchy 
Cripps McCrae Webber 
Diachuk McCrimmon Weiss 
Embury Miller Young 
Fjordbotten Oman 

Totals: Ayes - 4 Noes - 56 

[Interjections] 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Order in the gallery 
please, or we'll clear it. 

[Mr. Deputy Chairman declared the motion on the Bill 
as amended carried. Several members rose calling for a 
division. The division bell was rung] 

[Three minutes having elapsed, the House divided] 

For the motion: 
Adair Fyfe Osterman 
Anderson, C. Gogo Pahl 
Anderson, D. Harle Paproski 
Batiuk Hiebert Pengelly 
Bogle Horsman Planche 
Borstad Hyndman Reid 
Brad ley Isley Russell 
Campbell Johnston Schmidt 
Carter King Shaben 
Chambers Koziak Stevens 
Chichak Kroeger Stewart 
Clark. L. Kushner Stromberg 
Cook Leitch Thompson 
Cookson Lysons Topolnisky 
Crawford Magee Trynchy 
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Cripps McCrae Webber 
Diachuk McCrimmon Weiss 
Embury Miller Young 
Fjordbotten Oman 

Against the motion: 
Buck Notley Speaker, R. 
Clark, R. 

Totals: Ayes - 56 Noes - 4 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. YOUNG: Mr. Chairman, before I move to report 
the Bill, I have for distribution to hon. members the 
letter of October 31, which I supplied to Mr. Willetts, 
president of the Alberta Fire Fighters Association. If 
hon. members so wish, it's available. 

Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill 44, The Firefighters 
and Policemen Labour Relations Amendment Act, 
1979, as amended, be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 64 
The Statute Law Correction Act, 1979 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Are there any comments, 
questions, or amendments to be offered with respect to 
any section of this Act? 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. C R A W F O R D : Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill 
No. 64, The Statute Law Correction Act, 1979, be 
reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 68 
The Highway Traffic Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Are there any comments, 
questions, or amendments to be offered with respect to 
any section of this Act? 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I just don't think we can 
put this Bill through committee without the minister 
responsible reporting. As I said this afternoon on se­
cond reading, in principle we seem to be trying to 
cover the entire water front. I felt at that time that the 
Bill seemed to be rather hastily drafted, in that we were 
trying to cover just about everything we could possi­
bly think of on the front, the side, the top, and the 
underside of an automobile. I believe it's the responsi­
bility of the minister to indicate to the committee exact­
ly what he is trying to do in this legislation. 

MR. KROEGER: Mr. Chairman, in response to the 
question from the Member for Clover Bar, we're trying 
to revamp an existing Bill, clean it up, and make it 
more meaningful. If the member would like to go into 
specifics, we can do that. But as for the comment that 
it's all-encompassing, we are dealing with items that 
were in the existing Bill. There's really very little new 
in it other than just an adjustment and a clean-up, if 
that's a useful term. I would have to leave it to the 
member to ask specifics. Nothing is intended in the 

way of overreaching in the Bill. It's a matter of strai­
ghtening it out. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, one section that disturbs 
me is where we are looking at bumper heights. Can 
the minister indicate what we are going to do in the 
situation where we use load levellers — when the 
automobile or the vehicle is at a certain level, and then 
we use load levellers when we're pulling trailers and 
such? Can the minister indicate how this situation 
would be handled? 

MR. KROEGER: As I have experienced the way they 
work, load levellers won't distort the level of bumpers 
to the degree that is indicated in this Act as it is now 
constituted. Actually, what we're talking about here in 
that regard is a matter of modification, whereas the 
load leveller is a support instrument. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, maybe the minister can 
explain the section on seat belts, Section 47(4) I believe. 
Has the government taken a position on what the 
status of seat belts will be in relation to this Act and as 
it relates to government policy? 

MR. KROEGER: I haven't looked up the particular 
item in the Act that is being referred to, but the intent 
is that if seat belts have been removed . . . Did the 
member say No. 47? Well, it just means what it says, 
that seat belts are not to be removed. It doesn't relate to 
seat belt legislation as it has been discussed before. It 
doesn't have anything to do with the concept of 
mandatory seat belt legislation. It prohibits the remov­
al, because the Canadian safety standards require that 
cars be equipped with seat belts. Therefore, they must 
not be removed. 

DR. BUCK: Maybe the minister could take a few 
minutes and indicate to the committee just what mon­
itoring goes on in the province as to how safe our 
vehicles are, as far as the program that's in place at this 
time is concerned. I believe that if we are going to be 
making wide-ranging legislation such as this, it is 
incumbent upon the minister or the Solicitor General 
to indicate to us what practices are in place at this time 
to make sure that cars that are on the highways right 
now and that have not been modified are safe. Maybe 
the minister can give a brief dissertation on what is in 
place at this time to keep unsafe vehicles off the road. 
What monitoring is in place? 

MR. KROEGER: Mr. Chairman, if a car were to be 
inspected and found deficient, as outlined in this Act, 
the Solicitor General's people would simply require 
that car to come off the road. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, to the hon. Solicitor Gen­
eral, can the Solicitor General indicate to us what 
monitoring is in place at this time? If we're worried 
about the modified vehicles on the road, maybe we 
should be worrying about some of the unsafe vehicles 
on the road that are not modified. In this omnibus 
legislation that the minister is proposing and that we 
have before us, we seem to be worrying about vehicles 
that are modified, but I'd like to know what the 
government's doing about enforcing safe standards 
on vehicles on the road that are not modified. Can the 
Solicitor General give us some information? 
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MR. HARLE: Only in general terms, Mr. Chairman. 
Obviously, whatever the legal requirements are, the 
police forces in the province have to use their discretion 
and their observation of vehicles, and they are continu­
ally laying charges for vehicles that do not meet the 
requirements. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I'm just trying to ascertain 
in my own mind — if the program we now have in 
place does not keep off the road the driver who is 
unsafe because of mechanical deficiencies, bare tires, and 
poor steering, what do we have in place to enforce the 
legislation that's before us at this time? It's fine to 
bring in legislation. I agree with a lot of this; I don't 
agree with a lot of it. But I would like to know what 
we're going to do about enforcing it. If we don't have 
an adequate enforcing system in place now, are we 
going to be having officers running around with 
tape measures to check if the bumpers are a centimetre 
too high or a centimetre too low? What mechanism is 
in place? 

MR. KROEGER: If the member is making specific 
reference to bumper heights, yes, that's exactly what 
will happen. Cars will be checked to make certain that 
they meet the specifications as set out by the Canadian 
safety standards. We're not talking about changing 
anything as far as these cars are concerned except that 
they conform to Canadian safety standards. When and 
if this is proclaimed, if a car were obviously out of line, 
too high or too low — it goes both ways — that car 
certainly could be stopped and measured, and that 
person charged. 

DR. REID: Mr. Chairman, I have another concern over 
Section 47(4) that I would like to address to the minis­
ter. This section as written would prohibit removal of 
the original seat belts and substitution of a better type 
of seat belt. I'm thinking of the substitution of the 
inertial type or of a shoulder/lap belt combination in 
place of a lap belt. 

The other thing that concerns me is that it would 
prohibit the removal of air bags if they become stand­
ard equipment — there are considerable problems with 
air bags in that they have no effect in lateral collisions 
— and the substitution of a good seat belt mechanism, 
which in actual fact is a better mechanism in most 
collisions. Air bags are very effective in head-on colli­
sions but not in tail-end or lateral collisions. I was 
wondering if the wording is not a bit too prohibitive 
and if there should be allowance for the substitution of 
an equivalent or better system than the original 
equipment. 

MR. KROEGER: I'm sure this couldn't constitute a 
problem. For instance, if a seat belt that was original 
equipment were frayed, and you undertook to change 
it and put in a new one, this Act wouldn't prohibit 
anything like that. That would simply be a replace­
ment. Beyond that, I would also be very certain that no 
one would ever be charged if he put in a better seat belt 
than the original equipment, if anyone wanted to do 
that. 

MR. R. C L A R K : To the minister, would it be fair to 
say that this piece of legislation then puts into good 
repair — if I might use that term, and it's not well 
phrased — the whole question of automobile safety in 

Alberta? Or is it the intention of the minister to be back 
next spring, or perhaps next fall, with another go at 
this? I really want to ascertain if this is basically an 
overall look at automobile safety legislation in the 
province or if it is a piecemeal approach. 

MR. KROEGER: I'm not prepared to say that this is 
the be-all and end-all. I think it will take care of a lot of 
deficiencies we now have. Just as a comment rather 
than a statement of fact, I'd be interested in some 
approach to vehicle inspection as a follow-up to this. I 
can't tell you what form that could best take, but I 
think something could be instituted that would make 
it a little more cohesive; perhaps make it more manda­
tory to bring cars up to standards. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Minister, some months ago you 
made statements with regard to compulsory seat belt 
legislation. I assume that with the section my col­
league referred to, with regard to making it illegal to 
remove seat belts, the government has made the deci­
sion that before long we'll see compulsory seat belt 
legislation, will we? 

MR. KROEGER: Not necessarily. This is something 
we've discussed. Actually, I'm not sure about having 
made statements; I've responded to questions. Certain­
ly, a lot of discussion has been carried out in various 
ways. No decision has been taken that we will go to 
mandatory seat belts at any specific time. I certainly 
indicated my interest in the subject after being in­
volved in it. I've had no hesitation in saying that seat 
belts work, but I've always drawn the distinction be­
tween whether seat belts do the job and making them 
mandatory. As yet, we haven't approached the point 
where we're ready to make that decision. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Then I take it, Mr. Minister, that one 
can conclude from that comment that the minister 
doesn't have a position as to whether seat belt legisla­
tion is desirable or not. I ask the question very frankly, 
Mr. Minister, because . . . I said earlier that comments 
had been attributed to the minister; if that wasn't the 
case, I'd be pleased to have the minister straighten the 
record. It would seem to me that if we're looking at 
rather getting our whole safety legislation into place, 
and if the government is going to move on seat belt 
legislation, this would have been a logical time to 
bring the matter forward. That's really why I pose the 
question. I think it would be helpful now if we knew 
where the minister stood in the matter. 

MR. NOTLEY: He has the evidence, just not the 
support in caucus. 

MR. HORSMAN: Move an amendment, Bob. 

MR. R. C L A R K : I'm not the minister. 

AN HON. MEMBER: Let us know where you stand. 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Order please. Order 
please. 

MR. KROEGER: Mr. Chairman, I have no difficulty at 
all in commenting on this. But I also can't speak for 
every member of this House nor for every citizen of the 
province. So while I've made it very clear that I believe 
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seat belts do the job, I certainly can't take a position for 
everybody in the House and say we should or must go 
with mandatory seat belts. I guess there has to be an 
educational process that hasn't been completed. 

MR. NOTLEY: In the caucus. 

DR. BUCK: Mr. Chairman, I would like to ask the 
minister a question or two and make a suggestion. 
I'm not convinced that in this legislation we are 
genuinely interested in having safe vehicles on the 
highway. I say with great hesitancy that I think with 
this legislation we're really trying to pick on a partic­
ular group of people in this province. I say that very 
hesitantly, but I feel I must say it. 

My young son came home with all that junk on the 
back of his window, and I said to him, that will go off 
immediately . . . 

AN HON. MEMBER: It's still there. 

DR. BUCK: It's tough enough . . . No, it's not still 
there. It's tough enough to do a head turn without 
getting wiped out, without looking through the 
cracks to see if somebody is coming upon you. Father 
said, it will be removed, and it was removed, [applause] 

MR. R. C L A R K : Walt, you want to savor that moment. 

MR. NOTLEY: [Inaudible] . . . what it means to do 
what they're told, Wally. 

DR. BUCK: But at the same time, when I was trying to 
explain to my young son that you have to be able to 
see where you're going, he said, okay, Dad, that's fair 
ball. I said, you know the windows are painted so that 
you can't see in if you're trying to identify if it's one 
driver or two drivers, or if they've switched positions — 
that sometimes does happen when a police officer is 
chasing you. I've known this to happen at 90 miles an 
hour; drivers have switched positions. 

AN HON. MEMBER: You shouldn't have done it. 

DR. BUCK: Not in my case. But my young son came 
back to me and said, now Dad, what is the difference 
between having the windows obscured in a van and 
having some of these camper units where you cannot 
see except through side-view mirrors? And I had to 
admit the kid was right. You know, what is the 
difference? 

So I think, Mr. Minister, in all fairness we have to 
look further and a little more deeply than we have in 
this legislation. So I hope we shall take a little bigger 
look. 

Mr. Chairman, the last representation I want to make 
to the minister and to the members of the committee is 
that I think our driving habits and standards of driv­
ing need to be upgraded. Mr. Minister, I made this 
representation to the former minister, and I'm making 
it to you. Now that we have our drivers' licences 
coming up when our birthdays come up every five 
years, I think there would be some merit, when we send 
the licence out for renewal every five years, that we send 
out the driver's manual with a self-administered test. 
That will force the person at least to read the driver's 
manual and send back the self-administered test. You 
have to look in the book to be able to answer those 

questions. Mr. Minister, you and I know the old say­
ing, you must have got your licence by mail. We all 
know that that was exactly the way many people in this 
province got it. You went and paid your $2 and you 
got your driver's licence. 

As driving becomes more complicated. I think it's 
incumbent upon us as legislators to see that some of 
these drivers are upgraded. I know we cannot go to 
compulsory driving courses. We just can't pick that 
up. But I think there would be a great deal of merit if 
we would send the book out, just as we do for young 
people taking their learner's and the driving test. 
They have to read the manual, and then let them send 
the self-administered test in. They might have to get 
75 per cent, because if you read it out of the book, you 
should be able to get 100 per cent. I believe that would 
not cost us a lot of money and would not require any 
additional staff in your office. I think it would serve a 
purpose, at least a small step in upgrading our driv­
ing habits in this province. 

I thank you, Mr. Chairman. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MR. KROEGER: I ask that this Bill be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

Bill 76 
The School Amendment Act, 1979 

MR. DEPUTY C H A I R M A N : Are there any comments, 
questions, or amendments to be offered with respect to 
any section of this Act? 

MR. KING: Mr. Chairman, the hon. Leader of the 
Opposition asked at second reading whether we could 
provide information as to which of these amendments 
had been requested either by the ASTA, the ATA, or 
some other organization. I'm afraid that over the dinn­
er hour I was not able to get written information that 
would provide that. I'm prepared to make a statement 
as to my recollection of this, section by section. Alter­
nately, I could provide that information in written 
form to the leader at a later date. I'd do whichever he 
would prefer. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Section by section. 

MR. KING: Mr. Chairman, then to do it section by 
section, those sections which deal with petitions and 
public meetings which flow from petitions are not the 
result of any official representation from either the 
ASTA or the ATA. They are the result of representa­
tions which came to us from citizens in two different 
jurisdictions. In meetings which I personally held with 
the boards in those affected jurisdictions, they expressed 
interest in and support for the concept of these amend­
ments. The jurisdictions we're referring to are the 
Calgary Board of Education and the Calgary Roman 
Catholic Separate School Board. Those are the amend­
ments to page 4, Mr. Chairman. 

Section 5 of the amending Bill, which deals with 
conflict of interest, is the result of representations made 
by the Alberta School Trustees' Association, most re­
cently by resolution at their convention last week in 
Calgary. That of course is not as to the detail of the 
amendment but to its principle. Those are sections 5, 6, 
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and 7 of the amending Bill. 
Section 8 of the amending Bill is not the result of 

any official representation; it is the result of our ex­
perience in the Westlock School Division, where we 
have a trustee in place, and where representations were 
made to us from the community that perhaps he could 
be replaced by an elected board before October 1980. 
When we had that question under consideration, we 
discovered it was not legally possible to have a by-
election for an entire board. In that circumstance, we 
would legally be required to wait until October 1980. 

Sections 9, 10, and 11 are the three sections which 
make operative the redistribution of undeclared corpo­
rate assessment. They are not the result of any represen­
tation we have received. As I said, they are the result of 
policy decisions which were made and affirmed in this 
House. 

Section 12 is the result of representations made to us 
by a number of individual school boards which operate 
early childhood services programs. One that comes to 
mind is the Edmonton Public School Board. Some 
boards throughout the province had received a legal 
interpretation or an informal interpretation, that under 
the Act they were not permitted to charge tuition or 
any other fees. They individually made the representa­
tion to us for a change. 

Section 13 is the result of representations we received 
from both the Alberta School Trustees' Association and 
the Alberta Teachers' Association. 

Section 14 is the result of a representation which we 
received from a judge of the Court of Queen's Bench 
who has sat as a board of reference on a number of 
occasions. 

Section 15 was internally generated. It is the result of 
an apparent conflict between the regulation provided 
by the Local Authorities Board and the regulation 
provided by the Department of Education. We have a 
written statement from the Local Authorities Board 
that it causes no administrative problems or problems 
in principle with them. 

Section 16 is the result of representations we received 
from municipalities. It is often the case that they have 
not struck their mill rate by May 1 and are therefore not 
in a practical position to make the payment required of 
them by law. Just as a matter of practice, they have 
been making these payments later, often in June or 
July. Technically they have been in contravention of 
the Act. 

Section 17 is internally generated, the result of a 
policy decision made by government caucus. Section 
18 is the result of a representation from the Alberta 
School Trustees' Association. Section 19 was internally 
generated, the result of an apparent misinterpretation 
which occurs around that section of the Act as it is 
presently worded. Section 20 is the result of representa­
tions from both the Alberta Teachers' Association and 
the Alberta School Trustees' Association, as well as 
individual boards. Section 21 relates directly to my ear­
lier comments about Section 142 of the Act and reflects 
a policy decision of the government. 

Mr. Chairman, the balance of the sections are entirely 
consequential on the ones I have earlier described. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Chairman, I might express my 
thanks to the minister. Could we go back to Section 8 
and ask what the minister's expectations are as far as 
the Westlock board is concerned? 

MR. KING: As a result of representations I received 
directly and indirectly from a variety of interested peo­
ple in that division, we have made the decision that the 
trustee will continue to act until the time of the elec­
tions in October 1980. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Is that, if I can use the term, a 
commitment? It's the government's expectation that all 
subdivisions in the Westlock school board will be up 
for election in November 1980? 

MR. KING: Barring some absolutely unforeseen devel­
opment between now and then, yes, that is our 
intention. 

MR. NOTLEY: Mr. Chairman, if I could go back to 
Section 5, with respect to petitions for public meetings. 
At present Section 5(4) reads: 

(a) . . . elect four persons . . . and 
(b) by resolution of the meeting identify the 

areas of concern to be studied by the 
committee. 

Apparently we're now changing that to: 
. . . identify the areas of concern related to 
the purposes and objectives stated in the peti­
tion, that are to be studied by the committee. 

I wonder if the minister might give us a bit of 
background on that. I raise it because I've had some 
experience in my own constituency with meetings of 
this nature. In at least one case, while there were suffi­
cient people to petition for a meeting some very useful 
things came out of the public meeting that really were 
not related directly to the petition itself, and I think 
made it possible to resolve what was a pretty touchy, 
difficult situation. 

Are we not foreclosing the ability of a committee set 
up under this section of the Act to de-pressurize the 
kind of situation which invariably gives cause to the 
petition for a public meeting in the first place? 

MR. KING: Mr. Chairman, in one of the situations to 
which I alluded earlier — and under the circumstances 
I would prefer not to be specific about it — the 
argument was made that many people had signed a 
petition which alluded to a particular set of problems. 
Their signatures on that petition validated the public 
meeting, but at the public meeting there was discus­
sion about and consequently resolutions about issues 
which, when they signed the petition, they had not 
anticipated would be under discussion; and issues 
which, had they anticipated their being discussed at 
the meeting, they would not have signed the petition 
in support of. So the suggestion was made that the 
petition be worded in such a way as to make clear to 
those who signed what question would be under dis­
cussion at the public meeting. 

This does not preclude discussion on more general 
matters. This simply precludes those more general 
matters being referred to the committee for extended 
consideration and recommendation. In other words, at 
the public meeting you can still discuss in a general 
way and express concerns such as you have described. 

Of course, there is also the possibility of putting a 
saving clause on the petition. In other words, it would 
be legal, even the way this section is written, for the 
petition to read: to discuss (a), (b), (c). (d), and such 
other matters as the participants at the meeting may 
determine. That simply draws attention to the fact that 
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anyone considering signing that petition must be 
aware that his signature may then be in support of 
something which is unknown or not anticipated at the 
time he puts his signature to the petition. So he can 
sign, but he will then be signing in the knowledge 
that his signature may lend support to that activity at 
the meeting. 

As I said a moment ago, the other thing to remem­
ber is that this does not preclude discussion of more 
general issues. In the absence of what I call the saving 
feature of a petition, it would simply prevent those 
from being referred to the committee which is created 
out of the meeting. 

MR. NOTLEY: Mr. Chairman, I think that as long as 
taxpayers realize that in the wording of a petition, the 
meeting can have a larger area, if you like, provid­
ing the petition has this additional "and such other 
matters as may be discussed". The reason I'd like to 
draw that to your attention, Mr. Minister, is that while 
you're right in saying that the meeting can discuss 
Other problems in a general way, I think the fact that 
the meeting can refer those problems to the committee, 
and the committee can then evaluate them . . . 

I know of one instance that I can talk about with 
some degree of accuracy. The things referred to the 
committee gave the committee the latitude, I think, to 
reconcile what was a very difficult situation. We don't 
have these meetings unless you have a very intense 
situation. It may be that a principal is fired; it may be 
that a problem has split the community right down 
the centre. 

I don't object to the legislation, providing there is 
an escape hatch so that that meeting is not just an 
exercise in a very narrow confine. It could be, in fact, a 
more productive exercise, so that the committee in turn 
is able to evaluate what the options are and, I think, 
make it possible to reconcile some of the differences. 

MR. KING: The hon. member makes a very valid 
point. I would only say that, as is the case with a lot of 
legislation, you're simply constructing a framework; 
you're not constructing the superstructure at the same 
time. There will be exceptional circumstances. In the 
department we have made the decision that we will 
publish a pamphlet or brochure which will describe in 
layman's terms the effects of these sections of the Act 
and will also describe by example the best way in which 
these sections have been used in specific situations 
around the province, because they do perform an im­
portant safety-valve function such as you have de­
scribed. To ensure that they are well used by communi­
ties actually requires that you go beyond the law and 
describe the intention and the experience in other situa­
tions, and we are going to do that. 

MRS. CHICHAK: Mr. Chairman, just on a point be­
fore us at the moment, I wanted to make a couple of 
comments to recognize the provision being made in 
this legislation. When a petition is prepared and circu­
lated and signatures are being obtained, I think the 
important factor to recognize is that when a petition is 
presented, the names are on that petition for a specific 
matter or matters. If that petition doesn't include all 
other matters that may be raised at a meeting or put to 
a committee, the signatures on that petition cannot be 
used when other issues are being raised at the meet­
ing, taking advantage of the meeting that is being 

held and the citizens that have gathered for the pur­
pose of the meeting. The use of the signatures will be 
applicable only to those aspects described in the peti­
tion, and it would have that validity. Other matters 
would be considered as having been raised in the 
course of the meeting but not necessarily with the 
support and back-up of all the signatories to the peti­
tion, unless, of course, all the signatories are present 
and taking that stand. 

To make that very clear, if I put my name on a 
petition for a specific subject or specific matters, the 
committee that is going to be presenting the petition 
on my behalf may represent my views to the meeting 
but cannot use my signature to present other views on 
which they did not have any dialogue with me. There­
fore, they can't take that as an additional lever, so to 
speak, for other issues. I think that if those two are very 
distinct and clear, certainly I would not see dialogue 
on other matters at a meeting as being precluded, so 
long as they are put forward in the proper perspective. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Minister, with regard to Section 
17, I had some concern expressed to me with regard to 
this question of the minister in essence directing where 
students may attend. From the explanation we've had 
and from looking at the legislation, I take it that this 
is only in a situation where a change in boundaries has 
been approved by an order in council. It would be only 
under those conditions. We wouldn't find the minister, 
if I could use the term, trotting around the province, 
directing school boards as to where they might send 
students within a school system. 

Mr. Minister, I like the comment that was, related to 
me, that at the trustees' meeting in Calgary, I think 
the minister said that he felt there hadn't been an 
inordinate amount of interference by the minister in 
questions of local jurisdiction. Perhaps we will forego 
that argument for another occasion, other than to say 
that I think it would be a serious mistake if the minis­
ter's departmental people got involved in the question 
of trying to tell school boards where attendance 
boundaries are going to be, and so on. 

On the other hand, Mr. Minister, if this is in the Act 
solely to deal with, for example, the Redwater situa­
tion, which the minister alluded to earlier today, and if 
we could have that kind of assurance from the minister, 
certainly some of the fears expressed to me are 
alleviated. 

MR. KING: Just to be perfectly clear, Mr. Chairman, 
this section applies only to situations in which the 
boundary between two local jurisdictions has been 
changed. It does not apply under any circumstances to 
boundary changes within a jurisdiction. It applies 
only where the boundary between two divisions has 
been changed. Further, it applies only where that is the 
result of a provincial government initiative. This will 
not have application where a boundary change is the 
result of an annexation proceeding, for example. 

So I can say to you that, given those limits, to the 
best of my knowledge this would apply only in the 
case of the boundary situation between the county of 
Thorhild and the MD of Sturgeon. That's the only 
application it would have in the province. 

Having said that, I just want to remind hon. 
members that there are in fact two parts to this. A later 
amendment, Section 21 of the amending Bill, has the 
potential of providing the same opportunity with re­
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spect to Section 150 on language instruction, but it is 
not our intention to proclaim that at the present time. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Mr. Minister, if I correctly understand 
the last comment the minister made, that would relate 
only to the commitment the minister indicated earlier, 
dealing with language. That's really under Section 21 
of the Bill before the House. 

MR. KING: Again, I am very aware of the concern the 
hon. leader alludes to, that we might in the legislation 
create too sweeping an opportunity for intervention by 
the minister. I don't desire that that should happen, 
and I don't want anyone to have the impression that it 
is happening. So with respect to boundary changes 
the section was very narrowly worded. With respect to 
language instruction it was also very narrowly 
worded, so that it applies only to instruction pursuant 
to Section 150 of the Act, which is language instruc­
tion. It therefore relates directly to the comments I 
made on second reading about desiring to evidence 
concrete support for the policy statement most recently 
made by the first ministers on February 22, 1978, in 
Montreal. 

MR. R. C L A R K : I assume, Mr. Minister, that Section 
21 would be used only as a last resort, if I might use 
the term, after the departmental officials and everyone 
else, including the minister, had met with the groups 
involved. This is absolutely a last resort section. 

MR. KING: Absolutely. Not only will departmental 
officials be involved in those situations, but the affected 
MLAs and I personally. 

MR. R. SPEAKER: I've had one phone call with 
regard to Section 64. I believe that's Section 9 of the 
Bill. I wonder what projections the minister has done 
with regard to — the concern was not for the first three 
or four years, but that possibly five, six, seven, eight, or 
nine years down the road, there would be quite a shift 
in the amount of funding available to the public 
school system. That was the concern of one person who 
phoned. Has the minister done some calculations, pro­
jected some possible shift of funding and just what 
might happen? Or does it look like it may be fairly 
equitable after this transition period, as it potentially is 
now? 

MR. KING: We did only what might be described as 
superficial analysis of the longer term — five, six, or 
seven years. We didn't go any further because on the 
basis of that we were satisfied that over five years the 
growth in the assessment base of the jurisdiction 
would compensate for the loss in absolute dollar terms. 
Now, the proportionate redistribution continues un­
changed into the future. So on the one hand, when we 
adjust the proportion from one jurisdiction to another, 
that will have effect indefinitely into the future. But in 
terms of the dollar loss and the eventual recovery of it, 
we expect that — for some jurisdictions in two years, 
for some in four or five, but for all of them within that 
time — they will recover the dollar value out of the 
growth in assessment. 

[Title and preamble agreed to] 

MRS. OSTERMAN: Mr. Chairman, I move that Bill 
76, The School Amendment Act, 1979, be reported. 

[Motion carried] 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Chairman, I move the commit­
tee rise and report progress. 

[Motion carried] 

[Mr. Speaker in the Chair] 

MR. PURDY: Mr. Speaker, the Committee of the 
Whole Assembly has had under consideration Bills 64, 
68, and 76, and Bills 34 and 44 with amendments. 

MR. SPEAKER: Before asking the House to approve 
the report, I should perhaps refer to the fact that a 
number of these Bills received second reading today 
and went to the committee on the same day. There 
seems to be a moot point as to whether committee is 
really a stage, but it's usually referred as such. Possibly 
the Assembly might wish to indicate unanimous ap­
proval of that step having been done. Is it the wish of 
the Assembly? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

MR. SPEAKER: Having heard the report, do you all 
agree? 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Speaker, tomorrow after the 
report of the Private Bills Committee, it may be possi­
ble to bring those Bills for second reading. I think the 
House would hope that could be done, if the committee 
can complete one more meeting before 2:30 p.m. Other 
than that, the work proposed as Government Bills 
would be the ones remaining on the Order Paper that 
are short of third reading. I think we won't be able to 
do Bill 62 tomorrow because of the Premier's absence. 
Other than that, it will just be generally what's on the 
Order Paper. 

MR. R. C L A R K : Might I ask the Government House 
Leader if it's the intention to do second readings first 
— primarily The Architects Act and The Health Occu­
pations Act — or, in fact, to go into committee first? 

MR. CRAWFORD: Mr. Speaker, the question of second 
reading of those two Acts is still under consideration. 
So we would be going into committee first. 

Mr. Speaker, I move the House now adjourn until 
tomorrow at 2:30 p.m. 

HON. MEMBERS: Agreed. 

[At 10:12 p.m., on motion, the House adjourned to 
Wednesday at 2:30 p.m.] 




